

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK, LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON : Jul 25 2016

----- LOW BIDDER -----	----- 2ND BIDDER -----	----- 3RD BIDDER -----
PETERSEN BROTHERS, INC. 2008 EAST VALLEY HIGHWAY	DIRT AND AGGREGATE INTERCHANGE 20905 NE SANDY BLVD	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA 712 S WASHINGTON ST 99336-5607
SUMNER WA 983909579 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 651100	FAIRVIEW OR 970247785 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 221850	KENNEWICK WA 993360616 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100342

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S EST.						
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
PREPARATION									
1	MOBILIZATION								
		L.S.			17.40 %		48.86 %		11.65 %
			26,870.00	31,546.05	4,676.05	40,000.00	13,130.00	30,000.00	3,130.00
2	REMOVING GUARDRAIL 13920.0000	L.F.	3.0000	3.0900	3.00 %	5.0000	66.67 %	3.2500	8.33 %
			41,760.00	43,012.80	1,252.80	69,600.00	27,840.00	45,240.00	3,480.00
3	REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR 40.0000	EACH	155.0000	173.0100	11.62 %	250.0000	61.29 %	350.0000	125.81 %
			6,200.00	6,920.40	720.40	10,000.00	3,800.00	14,000.00	7,800.00
EROSION CONTROL AND ROADSIDE PLANTING									
4	SEEDING AND FERTILIZING BY HAND 300.0000	S.Y.	3.0000	5.9900	99.67 %	10.0000	233.33 %	10.5000	250.00 %
			900.00	1,797.00	897.00	3,000.00	2,100.00	3,150.00	2,250.00
5	EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL EST.				0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %
			5,000.00	5,000.00		5,000.00		5,000.00	
TRAFFIC									
6	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 8 FT. LONG POST 12418.0000	L.F.	24.7500	25.4600	2.87 %	24.5000	-1.01 %	26.5000	7.07 %
			307,345.50	316,162.28	8,816.78	304,241.00	-3,104.50	329,077.00	21,731.50
7	DELETED ITEM 0.0100	EACH	0.0001	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %
			0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
8	BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE B 5.0000	EACH	3,000.0000	454.9900	-84.83 %	1,500.0000	-50.00 %	2,800.0000	-6.67 %
			15,000.00	2,274.95	-12,725.05	7,500.00	-7,500.00	14,000.00	-1,000.00
9	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 NON-FLARED TERMINAL 21.0000	EACH	2,500.0000	3,084.5600	23.38 %	2,800.0000	12.00 %	2,200.0000	-12.00 %
			52,500.00	64,775.76	12,275.76	58,800.00	6,300.00	46,200.00	-6,300.00
10	BEAM GUARDRAIL BURIED TERMINAL TYPE 2 225.0000	L.F.	46.0000	68.6600	49.26 %	65.0000	41.30 %	42.5000	-7.61 %
			10,350.00	15,448.50	5,098.50	14,625.00	4,275.00	9,562.50	-787.50
11	RAISING EXISTING BEAM GUARDRAIL 290.0000	L.F.	4.0000	7.2500	81.25 %	10.0000	150.00 %	12.0000	200.00 %
			1,160.00	2,102.50	942.50	2,900.00	1,740.00	3,480.00	2,320.00

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK, LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

	LOW BIDDER	2ND BIDDER	3RD BIDDER
PETERSEN BROTHERS, INC. 2008 EAST VALLEY HIGHWAY	DIRT AND AGGREGATE INTERCHANGE 20905 NE SANDY BLVD	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA 712 S WASHINGTON ST 99336-5607	
SUMNER WA 983909579 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 651100	FAIRVIEW OR 970247785 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 221850	KENNEWICK WA 993360616 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100342	

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT
TRAFFIC										
12	TRANSPORTABLE ATTENUATOR									
	1.0000	EACH	6,000.0000	2,297.4800	-61.71 %	3,500.0000	-41.67 %	6,675.0000	11.25 %	
			6,000.00	2,297.48	-3,702.52	3,500.00	-2,500.00	6,675.00	675.00	
13	OPERATION OF TRANSPORTABLE ATTENUATOR									
	20.0000	HR	50.0000	75.9600	51.92 %	150.0000	200.00 %	60.0000	20.00 %	
			1,000.00	1,519.20	519.20	3,000.00	2,000.00	1,200.00	200.00	
14	REPAIR TRANSPORTABLE ATTENUATOR									
		EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %	
			1,000.00	1,000.00		1,000.00		1,000.00		
15	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST									
	85.0000	EACH	30.0000	44.8000	49.33 %	50.0000	66.67 %	53.0000	76.67 %	
			2,550.00	3,808.00	1,258.00	4,250.00	1,700.00	4,505.00	1,955.00	
16	CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A									
	96.0000	S.F.	20.0000	20.9000	4.50 %	25.0000	25.00 %	44.0000	120.00 %	
			1,920.00	2,006.40	86.40	2,400.00	480.00	4,224.00	2,304.00	
17	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL									
		L.S.			-7.40 %		-53.67 %		21.01 %	
			59,415.00	55,017.75	-4,397.25	27,524.00	-31,891.00	71,900.00	12,485.00	
18	PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN									
	407.0000	HR	10.0000	4.7700	-52.30 %	20.0000	100.00 %	5.2500	-47.50 %	
			4,070.00	1,941.39	-2,128.61	8,140.00	4,070.00	2,136.75	-1,933.25	
OTHER ITEMS										
19	ROADSIDE CLEANUP									
		EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %	
			1,000.00	1,000.00		1,000.00		1,000.00		
20	REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE									
		EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %	
			5.00	5.00		5.00		5.00		
21	MINOR CHANGE									
		CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		0.00 %	
			-1.00	-1.00		-1.00		-1.00		
22	SPCC PLAN									
		L.S.			156.68 %		0.00 %		-25.00 %	
			1,000.00	2,566.78	1,566.78	1,000.00	0.00	750.00	-250.00	
23	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 9 FT. LONG POST									
	193.0000	L.F.	30.0000	26.6500	-11.17 %	28.0000	-6.67 %	35.0000	16.67 %	
			5,790.00	5,143.45	-646.55	5,404.00	-386.00	6,755.00	965.00	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK, LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

	LOW BIDDER	2ND BIDDER	3RD BIDDER
	PETERSEN BROTHERS, INC. 2008 EAST VALLEY HIGHWAY	JIRT AND AGGREGATE INTERCHANGI 20905 NE SANDY BLVD	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA 712 S WASHINGTON ST 99336-5607
	SUMNER WA 983909579 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 651100	FAIRVIEW OR 970247785 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 221850	KENNEWICK WA 993360616 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100342

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S. EST.						
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
OTHER ITEMS									
24	BEAM GUARDRAIL ANCHOR TYPE 10								
	16.0000	EACH	840.0000	817.3700	-2.69 %	1,000.0000	19.05 %	2,000.0000	138.10 %
			13,440.00	13,077.92	-362.08	16,000.00	2,560.00	32,000.00	18,560.00
		BASE TOTAL	\$564,274.50	\$578,422.61	2.51 %	\$588,888.00	4.36 %	\$631,859.25	11.98 %
ALTERNATE A1									
25	REMOVING GUARDRAIL								
	1003.0000	L.F.	3.0000	3.4100	13.67 %	5.0000	66.67 %	4.5000	50.00 %
			3,009.00	3,420.23	411.23	5,015.00	2,006.00	4,513.50	1,504.50
26	REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR								
	2.0000	EACH	155.0000	173.0900	11.67 %	250.0000	61.29 %	600.0000	287.10 %
			310.00	346.18	36.18	500.00	190.00	1,200.00	890.00
27	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 8 FT. LONG POST								
	897.0000	L.F.	24.7500	25.9300	4.77 %	24.5000	-1.01 %	28.0000	13.13 %
			22,200.75	23,259.21	1,058.46	21,976.50	-224.25	25,116.00	2,915.25
28	DELETED ITEM								
	0.0100	EACH	0.0001	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %
			0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
29	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 NON-FLARED TERMINAL								
	2.0000	EACH	2,500.0000	3,162.0500	26.48 %	2,800.0000	12.00 %	2,800.0000	12.00 %
			5,000.00	6,324.10	1,324.10	5,600.00	600.00	5,600.00	600.00
30	DELETED ITEM								
	0.0100	EACH	0.0001	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %
			0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00
31	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST								
	6.0000	EACH	30.0000	58.2500	94.17 %	50.0000	66.67 %	98.5000	228.33 %
			180.00	349.50	169.50	300.00	120.00	591.00	411.00
32	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL								
		L.S.			49.24 %		-60.08 %		67.66 %
			5,010.00	7,476.83	2,466.83	2,000.00	-3,010.00	8,400.00	3,390.00
33	PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN								
	44.0000	HR	10.0000	4.7700	-52.30 %	20.0000	100.00 %	5.2500	-47.50 %
			440.00	209.88	-230.12	880.00	440.00	231.00	-209.00

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK, LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

----- LOW BIDDER -----	----- 2ND BIDDER -----	----- 3RD BIDDER -----
PETERSEN BROTHERS, INC. 2008 EAST VALLEY HIGHWAY	DIRT AND AGGREGATE INTERCHANG 20905 NE SANDY BLVD	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA 712 S WASHINGTON ST 99336-5607
SUMNER WA 983909579 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 651100	FAIRVIEW OR 970247785 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 221850	KENNEWICK WA 993360616 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100342

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	ENGR'S. EST.	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT
ALTERNATE A1										
34	MOBILIZATION ALTERNATES - A1	L.S.			95.14 %			93.69 %		176.70 %
			1,807.00	3,526.18	1,719.18	3,500.00	1,693.00	5,000.00	3,193.00	
ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL			\$37,956.75	\$44,912.11	18.32 %	\$39,771.50	4.78 %	\$50,651.50	33.45 %	
ALTERNATE A2										
35	REMOVING GUARDRAIL	L.F.	3.0000	3.4000	13.33 %	5.0000	66.67 %	4.8500	61.67 %	
	900.0000		2,700.00	3,060.00	360.00	4,500.00	1,800.00	4,365.00	1,665.00	
36	REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR	EACH	1.0000	155.0000	207.5400	33.90 %	250.0000	61.29 %	1,100.0000	609.68 %
	1.0000		155.00	207.54	52.54	250.00	95.00	1,100.00	945.00	
37	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 8 FT. LONG POST	L.F.	847.0000	24.7500	26.4000	6.67 %	24.5000	-1.01 %	28.0000	13.13 %
	847.0000		20,963.25	22,360.80	1,397.55	20,751.50	-211.75	23,716.00	2,752.75	
38	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 NON-FLARED TERMINAL	EACH	1.0000	2,500.0000	3,096.8900	23.88 %	2,800.0000	12.00 %	2,800.0000	12.00 %
	1.0000		2,500.00	3,096.89	596.89	2,800.00	300.00	2,800.00	300.00	
39	DELETED ITEM	EACH	0.0100	0.0001	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %
	0.0100		0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	
40	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST	EACH	6.0000	30.0000	45.5800	51.93 %	50.0000	66.67 %	98.5000	228.33 %
	6.0000		180.00	273.48	93.48	300.00	120.00	591.00	411.00	
41	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL	L.S.			30.06 %			-60.08 %		147.50 %
			5,010.00	6,515.97	1,505.97	2,000.00	-3,010.00	12,400.00	7,390.00	
42	PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN	HR	44.0000	10.0000	4.7700	-52.30 %	20.0000	100.00 %	5.2500	-47.50 %
	44.0000		440.00	209.88	-230.12	880.00	440.00	231.00	-209.00	
43	MOBILIZATION ALTERNATES - A2	L.S.			116.93 %			119.16 %		213.09 %
			1,597.00	3,464.30	1,867.30	3,500.00	1,903.00	5,000.00	3,403.00	
ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL			\$33,545.25	\$39,188.86	16.82 %	\$34,981.50	4.28 %	\$50,203.00	49.66 %	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK, LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

----- LOW BIDDER -----	----- 2ND BIDDER -----	----- 3RD BIDDER -----
PETERSEN BROTHERS, INC. 2008 EAST VALLEY HIGHWAY	DIRT AND AGGREGATE INTERCHANGI 20905 NE SANDY BLVD	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA 712 S WASHINGTON ST 99336-5607
SUMNER WA 983909579 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 651100	FAIRVIEW OR 970247785 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 221850	KENNEWICK WA 993360616 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100342

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT. DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/		% DIFF./ AMT. DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT			
ALTERNATE A3										
44	REMOVING GUARDRAIL 1795.0000	L.F.	3.0000 5,385.00	3.3000 5,923.50	10.00 % 538.50	5.0000 8,975.00	66.67 % 3,590.00	4.0500 7,269.75	35.00 % 1,884.75	
45	REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR 1.0000	EACH	155.0000 155.00	207.5400 207.54	33.90 % 52.54	250.0000 250.00	61.29 % 95.00	1,100.0000 1,100.00	609.68 % 945.00	
46	DELETED ITEM 0.0100	EACH	0.0001 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	
47	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 8 FT. LONG POST 1728.0000	L.F.	24.7500 42,768.00	25.2900 43,701.12	2.18 % 933.12	24.5000 42,336.00	-1.01 % -432.00	28.0000 48,384.00	13.13 % 5,616.00	
48	DELETED ITEM 0.0100	EACH	0.0001 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	
49	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 NON-FLARED TERMINAL 1.0000	EACH	2,500.0000 2,500.00	3,140.5700 3,140.57	25.62 % 640.57	2,800.0000 2,800.00	12.00 % 300.00	2,800.0000 2,800.00	12.00 % 300.00	
50	DELETED ITEM 0.0100	EACH	0.0001 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	
51	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST 12.0000	EACH	30.0000 360.00	45.6500 547.80	52.17 % 187.80	50.0000 600.00	66.67 % 240.00	98.5000 1,182.00	228.33 % 822.00	
52	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL L.S.				7.67 %		-80.04 %		75.65 %	
53	PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN 88.0000	HR	10.0000 880.00	4.7700 419.76	-52.30 % -460.24	20.0000 1,760.00	100.00 % 880.00	5.2500 462.00	-47.50 % -418.00	
54	MOBILIZATION ALTERNATES - A3 L.S.				13.91 %		7.59 %		53.70 %	
			3,253.00	3,705.63	452.63	3,500.00	247.00	5,000.00	1,747.00	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK, LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

----- LOW BIDDER -----	----- 2ND BIDDER -----	----- 3RD BIDDER -----
PETERSEN BROTHERS, INC. 2008 EAST VALLEY HIGHWAY	DIRT AND AGGREGATE INTERCHANGE 20905 NE SANDY BLVD	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA 712 S WASHINGTON ST 99336-5607
SUMNER WA 983909579 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 651100	FAIRVIEW OR 970247785 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 221850	KENNEWICK WA 993360616 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100342

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	2ND BIDDER		% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	3RD BIDDER	
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT		PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT
ALTERNATE A3										
55	BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE B									
	1.0000	EACH	3,000.0000	454.9200	-84.84%	1,500.0000	-50.00%	3,200.0000	6.67%	
			3,000.00	454.92	-2,545.08	1,500.00	-1,500.00	3,200.00	200.00	
	ALTERNATE A3 TOTAL		<u>\$68,321.00</u>	<u>\$68,889.86</u>	<u>0.83%</u>	<u>\$63,721.00</u>	<u>-6.73%</u>	<u>\$86,997.75</u>	<u>27.34%</u>	
	BASE TOTAL		<u>\$564,274.50</u>	<u>\$578,422.61</u>	<u>2.51%</u>	<u>\$588,888.00</u>	<u>4.36%</u>	<u>\$631,859.25</u>	<u>11.98%</u>	
	BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$602,231.25</u>	<u>\$623,334.72</u>	<u>3.50%</u>	<u>\$628,659.50</u>	<u>4.39%</u>	<u>\$682,510.75</u>	<u>13.33%</u>	
	BASE + A1 + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$635,776.50</u>	<u>\$662,523.58</u>	<u>4.21%</u>	<u>\$663,641.00</u>	<u>4.38%</u>	<u>\$732,713.75</u>	<u>15.25%</u>	
	BASE + A1 + A2 + A3 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$704,097.50</u>	<u>\$731,413.44</u>	<u>3.88%</u>	<u>\$727,362.00</u>	<u>3.30%</u>	<u>\$819,711.50</u>	<u>16.42%</u>	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 16X313
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK,LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

----- 4TH BIDDER -----	----- 5TH BIDDER -----
COLUMBIA RIVER CONTRACTORS, II 15701 SE 135TH AVE 97015-8908 CLACKAMAS OR 970151070 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100426	CORAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 10780 SW CLUTTER RD SHERWOOD OR 97140-9563 WILSONVILLE OR 970700347 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 188245 CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S. EST.						
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
PREPARATION									
1	MOBILIZATION								
		L.S.			-40.45 %			141.91 %	
			26,870.00	16,000.00	-10,870.00		65,000.00	38,130.00	
2	REMOVING GUARDRAIL 13920.0000	L.F.	3.0000	4.8500	61.67 %	4.0000	33.33 %		
			41,760.00	67,512.00	25,752.00	55,680.00	13,920.00		
3	REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR 40.0000	EACH	155.0000	280.0000	80.65 %	200.0000	29.03 %		
			6,200.00	11,200.00	5,000.00	8,000.00	1,800.00		
EROSION CONTROL AND ROADSIDE PLANTING									
4	SEEDING AND FERTILIZING BY HAND 300.0000	S.Y.	3.0000	1.5000	-50.00 %	3.0000	0.00 %		
			900.00	450.00	-450.00	900.00	0.00		
5	EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL EST.				0.00 %			0.00 %	
			5,000.00	5,000.00		5,000.00			
TRAFFIC									
6	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 8 FT. LONG POST 12418.0000	L.F.	24.7500	22.2500	-10.10 %	27.0000	9.09 %		
			307,345.50	276,300.50	-31,045.00	335,286.00	27,940.50		
7	DELETED ITEM 0.0100	EACH	0.0001	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %		
			0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00		
8	BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE B 5.0000	EACH	3,000.0000	795.0000	-73.50 %	1,125.0000	-62.50 %		
			15,000.00	3,975.00	-11,025.00	5,625.00	-9,375.00		
9	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 NON-FLARED TERMINAL 21.0000	EACH	2,500.0000	2,375.0000	-5.00 %	2,775.0000	11.00 %		
			52,500.00	49,875.00	-2,625.00	58,275.00	5,775.00		
10	BEAM GUARDRAIL BURIED TERMINAL TYPE 2 225.0000	L.F.	46.0000	55.0000	19.57 %	55.0000	19.57 %		
			10,350.00	12,375.00	2,025.00	12,375.00	2,025.00		
11	RAISING EXISTING BEAM GUARDRAIL 290.0000	L.F.	4.0000	3.5000	-12.50 %	7.0000	75.00 %		
			1,160.00	1,015.00	-145.00	2,030.00	870.00		

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 16X313
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK,LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

----- 4TH BIDDER -----	----- 5TH BIDDER -----
COLUMBIA RIVER CONTRACTORS, INC 15701 SE 135TH AVE 97015-8908 CLACKAMAS OR 970151070 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100426	CORAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 10780 SW CLUTTER RD SHERWOOD OR 97140-9563 WILSONVILLE OR 970700347 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 188245 CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S. EST.						
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
TRAFFIC									
12	TRANSPORTABLE ATTENUATOR								
	1.0000	EACH	6,000.0000	20,150.0000	235.83 %	7,000.0000	16.67 %		
			6,000.00	20,150.00	14,150.00	7,000.00	1,000.00		
13	OPERATION OF TRANSPORTABLE ATTENUATOR								
	20.0000	HR	50.0000	56.0000	12.00 %	80.0000	60.00 %		
			1,000.00	1,120.00	120.00	1,600.00	600.00		
14	REPAIR TRANSPORTABLE ATTENUATOR								
		EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		
			1,000.00	1,000.00		1,000.00			
15	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST								
	85.0000	EACH	30.0000	58.0000	93.33 %	30.0000	0.00 %		
			2,550.00	4,930.00	2,380.00	2,550.00	0.00		
16	CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A								
	96.0000	S.F.	20.0000	57.2500	186.25 %	30.0000	50.00 %		
			1,920.00	5,496.00	3,576.00	2,880.00	960.00		
17	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL								
		L.S.			118.80 %		4.35 %		
			59,415.00	130,000.00	70,585.00	62,000.00	2,585.00		
18	PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN								
	407.0000	HR	10.0000	25.0000	150.00 %	11.0000	10.00 %		
			4,070.00	10,175.00	6,105.00	4,477.00	407.00		
OTHER ITEMS									
19	ROADSIDE CLEANUP								
		EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		
			1,000.00	1,000.00		1,000.00			
20	REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE								
		EST.			0.00 %		0.00 %		
			5.00	5.00		5.00			
21	MINOR CHANGE								
		CALC			0.00 %		0.00 %		
			-1.00	-1.00		-1.00			
22	SPCC PLAN								
		L.S.			-50.00 %		0.00 %		
			1,000.00	500.00	-500.00	1,000.00	0.00		
23	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 9 FT. LONG POST								
	193.0000	L.F.	30.0000	25.5000	-15.00 %	30.0000	0.00 %		
			5,790.00	4,921.50	-868.50	5,790.00	0.00		

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 16X313
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK,LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

		----- 4TH BIDDER -----	----- 5TH BIDDER -----
		COLUMBIA RIVER CONTRACTORS, IN	CORAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
		15701 SE 135TH AVE	10780 SW CLUTTER RD
		97015-8908	SHERWOOD OR 97140-9563
		CLACKAMAS OR 970151070	WILSONVILLE OR 970700347
		CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100426	CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 188245

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S. EST.					
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT

OTHER ITEMS

24	BEAM GUARDRAIL ANCHOR TYPE 10								
	16.0000	EACH	840.0000	775.0000	-7.74 %	850.0000	1.19 %		
			13,440.00	12,400.00	-1,040.00	13,600.00	160.00		
		BASE TOTAL	\$564,274.50	\$635,399.00	12.60 %	\$651,072.00	15.38 %		%

ALTERNATE A1

25	REMOVING GUARDRAIL								
	1003.0000	L.F.	3.0000	4.8500	61.67 %	5.0000	66.67 %		
			3,009.00	4,864.55	1,855.55	5,015.00	2,006.00		
26	REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR								
	2.0000	EACH	155.0000	300.0000	93.55 %	250.0000	61.29 %		
			310.00	600.00	290.00	500.00	190.00		
27	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 8 FT. LONG POST								
	897.0000	L.F.	24.7500	23.0000	-7.07 %	32.0000	29.29 %		
			22,200.75	20,631.00	-1,569.75	28,704.00	6,503.25		
28	DELETED ITEM								
	0.0100	EACH	0.0001	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %		
			0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00		
29	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 NON-FLARED TERMINAL								
	2.0000	EACH	2,500.0000	2,375.0000	-5.00 %	2,875.0000	15.00 %		
			5,000.00	4,750.00	-250.00	5,750.00	750.00		
30	DELETED ITEM								
	0.0100	EACH	0.0001	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %		
			0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00		
31	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST								
	6.0000	EACH	30.0000	58.0000	93.33 %	30.0000	0.00 %		
			180.00	348.00	168.00	180.00	0.00		
32	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL								
		L.S.			13.47 %		-0.20 %		
			5,010.00	5,685.00	675.00	5,000.00	-10.00		
33	PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN								
	44.0000	HR	10.0000	25.0000	150.00 %	11.0000	10.00 %		
			440.00	1,100.00	660.00	484.00	44.00		

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 16X313
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK,LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

	4TH BIDDER	5TH BIDDER
COLUMBIA RIVER CONTRACTORS, II	CORAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	
15701 SE 135TH AVE	10780 SW CLUTTER RD	
97015-8908	SHERWOOD OR 97140-9563	
CLACKAMAS OR 970151070	WILSONVILLE OR 970700347	
CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100426	CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 188245	CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S. EST. PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE A1									
34	MOBILIZATION ALTERNATES - A1								
		L.S.			160.10 %		176.70 %		
			1,807.00	4,700.00	2,893.00	5,000.00	3,193.00		
	ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL		\$37,956.75	\$42,678.55	12.44 %	\$50,633.00	33.40 %		
ALTERNATE A2									
35	REMOVING GUARDRAIL								
	900.0000	L.F.	3.0000	4.8500	61.67 %	4.0000	33.33 %		
			2,700.00	4,365.00	1,665.00	3,600.00	900.00		
36	REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR								
	1.0000	EACH	155.0000	300.0000	93.55 %	200.0000	29.03 %		
			155.00	300.00	145.00	200.00	45.00		
37	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 8 FT. LONG POST								
	847.0000	L.F.	24.7500	23.0000	-7.07 %	27.0000	9.09 %		
			20,963.25	19,481.00	-1,482.25	22,869.00	1,905.75		
38	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 NON-FLARED TERMINAL								
	1.0000	EACH	2,500.0000	2,375.0000	-5.00 %	2,775.0000	11.00 %		
			2,500.00	2,375.00	-125.00	2,775.00	275.00		
39	DELETED ITEM								
	0.0100	EACH	0.0001	0.0000	0.00 %	0.0000	0.00 %		
			0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00	0.00		
40	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST								
	6.0000	EACH	30.0000	58.0000	93.33 %	30.0000	0.00 %		
			180.00	348.00	168.00	180.00	0.00		
41	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL								
		L.S.			13.47 %		29.74 %		
			5,010.00	5,685.00	675.00	6,500.00	1,490.00		
42	PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN								
	44.0000	HR	10.0000	25.0000	150.00 %	11.0000	10.00 %		
			440.00	1,100.00	660.00	484.00	44.00		
43	MOBILIZATION ALTERNATES - A2								
		L.S.			56.54 %		150.47 %		
			1,597.00	2,500.00	903.00	4,000.00	2,403.00		
	ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL		\$33,545.25	\$36,154.00	7.78 %	\$40,608.00	21.05 %		

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK, LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

----- 4TH BIDDER -----	----- 5TH BIDDER -----
COLUMBIA RIVER CONTRACTORS, II 15701 SE 135TH AVE 97015-8908 CLACKAMAS OR 970151070 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100426	CORAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 10780 SW CLUTTER RD SHERWOOD OR 97140-9563 WILSONVILLE OR 970700347 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 188245

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MRAS	ENGR'S. EST.						
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE A3									
44	REMOVING GUARDRAIL 1795.0000	L.F.	3.0000 5,385.00	4.8500 8,705.75	61.67 % 3,320.75	4.0000 7,180.00	33.33 % 1,795.00		
45	REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR 1.0000	EACH	155.0000 155.00	300.0000 300.00	93.55 % 145.00	200.0000 200.00	29.03 % 45.00		
46	DELETED ITEM 0.0100	EACH	0.0001 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00		
47	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 - 8 FT. LONG POST 1728.0000	L.F.	24.7500 42,768.00	22.7500 39,312.00	-8.08 % -3,456.00	27.0000 46,656.00	9.09 % 3,888.00		
48	DELETED ITEM 0.0100	EACH	0.0001 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00		
49	BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 31 NON-FLARED TERMINAL 1.0000	EACH	2,500.0000 2,500.00	2,375.0000 2,375.00	-5.00 % -125.00	2,775.0000 2,775.00	11.00 % 275.00		
50	DELETED ITEM 0.0100	EACH	0.0001 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00	0.0000 0.00	0.00 % 0.00		
51	FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST 12.0000	EACH	30.0000 360.00	58.0000 696.00	93.33 % 336.00	30.0000 360.00	0.00 % 0.00		
52	PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL L.S.				-14.92 %		-0.20 %		
53	PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN 88.0000	HR	10.0000 880.00	25.0000 2,200.00	150.00 % 1,320.00	11.0000 968.00	10.00 % 88.00		
54	MOBILIZATION ALTERNATES - A3 L.S.				22.96 %		84.45 %		
			3,253.00	4,000.00	747.00	6,000.00	2,747.00		

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
 * * * BID CHECK REPORT * * *

DATE: 06/29/2016
 TIME: 08:09

PS&E JOB NO : 16X313 REVISION NO :
 CONTRACT NO : 008933 REGION NO : 4
 VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : XL4926
 HWY : SR 005,012,501
 TITLE : SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
 GUARDRAIL 2015-2017
 PROJECT : STPF-9999 (732)
 COUNTY(S) : CLARK, LEWIS

BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 20 2016
 AWARDED ON :

	4TH BIDDER	5TH BIDDER
COLUMBIA RIVER CONTRACTORS, I	CORAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY	
15701 SE 135TH AVE	10780 SW CLUTTER RD	
97015-8908	SHERWOOD OR 97140-9563	
CLACKAMAS OR 970151070	WILSONVILLE OR 970700347	
CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100426	CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 188245	CONTRACTOR NUMBER :

ITEM NO.	ITEM DESCRIPTION EST. QUANTITY	UNIT MEAS	ENGR'S. EST.						
			PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT. DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT. DIFF.	PRICE PER UNIT/ TOTAL AMOUNT	% DIFF./ AMT. DIFF.
ALTERNATE A3									
55	BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE B								
	1.0000	EACH	3,000.0000	795.0000	-73.50 %	1,125.0000	-62.50 %		
			3,000.00	795.00	-2,205.00	1,125.00	-1,875.00		
	ALTERNATE A3 TOTAL		<u>\$68,321.00</u>	<u>\$66,908.75</u>	<u>-2.07 %</u>	<u>\$75,264.00</u>	<u>10.16 %</u>		
	BASE TOTAL		<u>\$564,274.50</u>	<u>\$635,399.00</u>	<u>12.60 %</u>	<u>\$651,072.00</u>	<u>15.38 %</u>	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	
	BASE + A1 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$602,231.25</u>	<u>\$678,077.55</u>	<u>12.59 %</u>	<u>\$701,705.00</u>	<u>16.52 %</u>	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	
	BASE + A1 + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$635,776.50</u>	<u>\$714,231.55</u>	<u>12.34 %</u>	<u>\$742,313.00</u>	<u>16.76 %</u>	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	
	BASE + A1 + A2 + A3 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)		<u>\$704,097.50</u>	<u>\$781,140.30</u>	<u>10.94 %</u>	<u>\$817,577.00</u>	<u>16.12 %</u>	NO BID THIS ALTERNATE	

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 16X313

* * * ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * *

BIDS OPENED ON:

CONTRACT NO: 008933

* * * RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT * * *

Jul 20 2016

TITLE: SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
GUARDRAIL 2015-2017

REGION: 4

16X313

HWY: SR 005,012,501

1	\$623,334.72	BASE + A1	PETERSEN BROTHERS, INC. 2008 EAST VALLEY HIGHWAY SUMNER, WA 983909579
2	\$628,659.50	BASE + A1	DIRT AND AGGREGATE INTERCHANGE, INC. 20905 NE SANDY BLVD FAIRVIEW, OR 970247785
3	\$678,077.55	BASE + A1	COLUMBIA RIVER CONTRACTORS, INC. 15701 SE 135TH AVE 97015-8908 PO BOX 1070 CLACKAMAS, OR 970151070
4	\$682,510.75	BASE + A1	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA PAVEMENT SURFACE CONTROL 712 S WASHINGTON ST 99336-5607 PO BOX 7204 KENNEWICK, WA 993360616
5	\$701,705.00	BASE + A1	CORAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 10780 SW CLUTTER RD SHERWOOD OR 97140-9563 PO BOX 347 WILSONVILLE, OR 970700347
6	\$662,523.58	BASE + A1 + A2	PETERSEN BROTHERS, INC. 2008 EAST VALLEY HIGHWAY SUMNER, WA 983909579
7	\$663,641.00	BASE + A1 + A2	DIRT AND AGGREGATE INTERCHANGE, INC. 20905 NE SANDY BLVD FAIRVIEW, OR 970247785
8	\$714,231.55	BASE + A1 + A2	COLUMBIA RIVER CONTRACTORS, INC. 15701 SE 135TH AVE 97015-8908 PO BOX 1070 CLACKAMAS, OR 970151070

DOT_RGGB01

WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

PS&E JOB NO: 16X313

* * * ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS * * *

BIDS OPENED ON:

CONTRACT NO: 008933

* * * RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT * * *

Jul 20 2016

TITLE: SWR REGIONWIDE BASIC SAFETY
GUARDRAIL 2015-2017

REGION: 4

16X313

HWY: SR 005,012,501

9	\$732,713.75	BASE + A1 + A2	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA PAVEMENT SURFACE CONTROL 712 S WASHINGTON ST 99336-5607 PO BOX 7204 KENNEWICK, WA 993360616
10	\$742,313.00	BASE + A1 + A2	CORAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 10780 SW CLUTTER RD SHERWOOD OR 97140-9563 PO BOX 347 WILSONVILLE, OR 970700347
11	\$727,362.00	BASE + A1 + A2 + A3	DIRT AND AGGREGATE INTERCHANGE, INC. 20905 NE SANDY BLVD FAIRVIEW, OR 970247785
12	\$731,413.44	BASE + A1 + A2 + A3	PETERSEN BROTHERS, INC. 2008 EAST VALLEY HIGHWAY SUMNER, WA 983909579
13	\$781,140.30	BASE + A1 + A2 + A3	COLUMBIA RIVER CONTRACTORS, INC. 15701 SE 135TH AVE 97015-8908 PO BOX 1070 CLACKAMAS, OR 970151070
14	\$817,577.00	BASE + A1 + A2 + A3	CORAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY 10780 SW CLUTTER RD SHERWOOD OR 97140-9563 PO BOX 347 WILSONVILLE, OR 970700347
15	\$819,711.50	BASE + A1 + A2 + A3	CONSTRUCTION AHEAD, INC. DBA PAVEMENT SURFACE CONTROL 712 S WASHINGTON ST 99336-5607 PO BOX 7204 KENNEWICK, WA 993360616