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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 11/02/2016
* % % BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 07:08
PSEE JOB NO : 16A011 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : Nov 16 2016
CONTRACT NO : 008975 REGION NO  :1 AWARDED ON : Nov 22 2016
VERSION NO :4 WORK ORDER# : XL4897
iy "SR 020525 s LOW BIDDER  ——-mmmm  —mmmmmm OND BIDDER  ——-mmmm  —mmmmem 3RD BIDDER  —---m—-
TITLE 1SR 20 AND SR 525 GRANITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY  CEMEX CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS  LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES, INC.
EgslﬁéLSRing RD TO HOLBROOK RD 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE 20700 44TH AVE W SUITE 240 11497 HAVEKOST RD
L6AOLL LYNNWOOD, WA 98036-7735 08221-8798
PROJECT .. NHPP-0999(753) EVERETT WA 982011927 EVERETT WA 982030037 ANACORTES WA 982210729
COUNTY(S) - ISLAND CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100102 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 044002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 469025
ENGR*S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF.
PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION
L.S. 8.11% _25.44 % 13.70%
1,073,000.00 1,160,000.00  87,000.00 800,000.00 -273,000.00 1,220,000.00 147,000.00
2 REMOVAL OF STRUCTURES AND OBSTRUCTIONS
L.S. 13.94% 161.03 % 174.70%
48,270.00 55,000.00 6,730.00 126,000.00  77,730.00 132,600.00  84,330.00
GRADING
3 PAVEMENT REPAIR EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL
26463.0000 S.Y. 10.5000 13.0000 23.81% 16.0000 52.38 % 16.5000 57.14%
277,861.50 344,019.00  66,157.50 423,408.00 145,546.50 436,639.50 158,778.00
SURFACING
4 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE
2790.0000 TON 32.0000 25.0000 _21.88% 50.0000 56.25 % 657500 105.47 %
89,280.00 69,750.00 -19,530.00 139,500.00  50,220.00 183,442.50  94,162.50
LIQUID ASPHALT
5 ASPHALT FOR FOG SEAL
5.3000 TON 1,850.0000 2,000.0000 8.11% 2,100.0000 13.51% 2,520.0000 36.22%
9,805.00 10,600.00 795.00 11,130.00 1,325.00 13,356.00 3,551.00
HOT MIX ASPHALT
6 CRACK SEALING - FA
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00
7 PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT
508420.0000 S.Y. 2.3000 2.6000 13.04% 4.0000 73.91% 2.7500 19.57%
1,169,366.00 1,321,892.00 152,526.00 2,033,680.00 864,314.00 1,398,155.00 228,789.00
8 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
9 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00 % 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 11/02/2016
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 07:08
PS&E JOB NO : 16A011 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : Nov 16 2016
CONTRACT NO : 008975 REGION NO i1 AWARDED ON : Nov 22 2016
VERSION NO :4 WORK ORDER# : XL4897
Y “SR 020,525 e LOW BIDDER  ————-—— —————n 2ND BIDDER  ————-—— ——————o 3RD BIDDER  —--——--
TITLE SR 20 AND SR 525 GRANITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY  CEMEX CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS  LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES, INC.
EgslﬁéLgRiéZH RD TO HOLBROOK RD 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE 20700 44TH AVE W SUITE 240 11497 HAVEKOST RD
164011 LYNNWOOD, WA 98036-7735 98221-8798
PROJECT -, NHPP-9999(753) EVERETT WA 982011927 EVERETT WA 982030037 ANACORTES WA 982210729
COUNTY(S) : ISLAND CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100102 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 044002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 469025
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
HOT MIX ASPHALT
10 JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
149,130.00 149,130.00 149,130.00 149,130.00
11 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
88,700.00 88,700.00 88,700.00 88,700.00
12 ASPHALT COST PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
124,602.00 124,602.00 124,602.00 124,602.00
13 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00 % 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00 0.00
14 CYCLIC DENSITY PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
-8.00 -8.00 -8.00 -8.00
15 ASPHALT BINDER REVISION
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00 -1.00
16 SMOOTHNESS COMPLIANCE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
84,990.00 84,990.00 84,990.00 84,990.00
EROSION CONTROL AND ROADSIDE PLANTING
17 INLET PROTECTION
80.0000 EACH 105.0000 90.0000 -14.29% 106.0000 0.95% 140.0000 33.33%
8,400.00 7,200.00 -1,200.00 8,480.00 80.00 11,200.00 2,800.00
18 STREET CLEANING
52.0000 HR 150.0000 135.0000 -10.00 % 150.0000 0.00 % 205.5000 37.00%
7,800.00 7,020.00 -780.00 7,800.00 0.00 10,686.00 2,886.00
19 EROSION/WATER POLLUTION CONTROL
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
50,000.00 50,000.00 50,000.00 50,000.00
TRAFFIC
20 CEMENT CONC. TRAFFIC CURB AND GUTTER
678.0000 L.F. 27.0000 48.0000 77.78% 44.8000 65.93 % 52.0000 92.59%
18,306.00 32,544.00 14,238.00 30,374.40 12,068.40 35,256.00 16,950.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
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DATE: 11/02/2016

* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 07:08
PS&E JOB NO : 16A011 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : Nov 16 2016
CONTRACT NO : 008975 REGION NO i1 AWARDED ON : Nov 22 2016
VERSION NO :4 WORK ORDER# : XL4897
Y “SR 020,525 e LOW BIDDER  ————-—— —————n 2ND BIDDER  ————-—— ——————o 3RD BIDDER  —--——--
TITLE SR 20 AND SR 525 GRANITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY  CEMEX CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS  LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES, INC.
EgslﬁéLgRiéZH RD TO HOLBROOK RD 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE 20700 44TH AVE W SUITE 240 11497 HAVEKOST RD
164011 LYNNWOOD, WA 98036-7735 98221-8798
PROJECT -, NHPP-9999(753) EVERETT WA 982011927 EVERETT WA 982030037 ANACORTES WA 982210729
COUNTY(S) : ISLAND CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100102 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 044002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 469025
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
TRAFFIC
21 MODIFIED CEMENT CONC. TRAFFIC CURB AND GUTTER
30.0000 L.F. 70.0000 57.0000 -18.57% 53.7600 -23.20% 61.7000 -11.86%
2,100.00 1,710.00 -390.00 1,612.80 -487.20 1,851.00 -249.00
22 CEMENT CONC. TRAFFIC CURB
145.0000 L.F. 35.0000 50.0000 42.86% 44.8000 28.00 % 54.8000 56.57%
5,075.00 7,250.00 2,175.00 6,496.00 1,421.00 7,946.00 2,871.00
23 CEMENT CONC. PEDESTRIAN CURB
265.0000 L.F. 40.0000 40.0000 0.00% 44.8000 12.00 % 43.8000 9.50%
10,600.00 10,600.00 0.00 11,872.00 1,272.00 11,607.00 1,007.00
24 FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST
812.0000 EACH 46.0000 48.0000 4.35% 50.0000 8.70 % 60.3000 31.09%
37,352.00 38,976.00 1,624.00 40,600.00 3,248.00 48,963.60 11,611.60
25 PAINT LINE
312110.0000 L.F. 0.2400 0.1800 -25.00% 0.1400 -41.67 % 0.2100 -12.50%
74,906.40 56,179.80 -18,726.60 43,695.40 -31,211.00 65,543.10 -9,363.30
26 PLASTIC LINE
295660.0000 L.F. 1.2500 1.2500 0.00 % 0.9200 -26.40 % 1.3500 8.00%
369,575.00 369,575.00 0.00 272,007.20 -97,567.80 399,141.00 29,566.00
27 PLASTIC WIDE LANE LINE
18850.0000 L.F. 3.0000 3.0000 0.00% 2.0000 -33.33% 3.4000 13.33%
56,550.00 56,550.00 0.00 37,700.00 -18,850.00 64,090.00 7,540.00
28 PAINTED CROSSWALK LINE
6700.0000 S.F. 2.6000 3.0000 15.38% 1.6000 -38.46 % 3.4000 30.77%
17,420.00 20,100.00 2,680.00 10,720.00 -6,700.00 22,780.00 5,360.00
29 PLASTIC CROSSWALK LINE
3350.0000 S.F. 6.1000 6.5000 6.56% 12.0000 96.72 % 7.5000 22.95%
20,435.00 21,775.00 1,340.00 40,200.00 19,765.00 25,125.00 4,690.00
30 PAINTED STOP LINE
3260.0000 L.F. 4.2000 4.0000 -4.76% 1.7000 -59.52 % 4.8000 14.29%
13,692.00 13,040.00 -652.00 5,542.00 -8,150.00 15,648.00 1,956.00
31 PLASTIC STOP LINE
1630.0000 L.F. 9.9500 11.0000 10.55% 19.0000 90.95 % 12.3000 23.62%
16,218.50 17,930.00 1,711.50 30,970.00 14,751.50 20,049.00 3,830.50
32 PAINTED TRAFFIC ARROW
276.0000 EACH 83.0000 90.0000 8.43% 17.0000 -79.52% 103.0000 24.10%
22,908.00 24,840.00 1,932.00 4,692.00 -18,216.00 28,428.00 5,520.00
33 PLASTIC TRAFFIC ARROW
138.0000 EACH 138.0000 200.0000 44.93% 130.0000 -5.80% 226.0000 63.77%
19,044 .00 27,600.00 8,556.00 17,940.00 -1,104.00 31,188.00 12,144.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 11/02/2016
* * * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 07:08
PS&E JOB NO : 16A011 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : Nov 16 2016
CONTRACT NO : 008975 REGION NO  :1 AWARDED ON : Nov 22 2016
VERSION NO :4 WORK ORDER# : XL4897
Y “sR 020,525 s LOW BIDDER ——-—mmm  —mmmmmm 2ND BIDDER  ——mmmmm  —mmmmmm 3RD BIDDER  ——-—-mn
TITLE SR 20 AND SR 525 GRANITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY  CEMEX CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS  LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES, INC.
BOB GALBREATH RD TO HOLBROOK RD 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE 20700 44TH AVE W SUITE 240 11497 HAVEKOST RD
EgXéTi & ADA LYNNWOOD, WA 98036-7735 98221-8798
PROJECT . NHPP-9999(753) EVERETT WA 982011927 EVERETT WA 982030037 ANACORTES WA 982210729
COUNTY(S)  : ISLAND CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100102 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 044002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 469025
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./  PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT .DIFF.
TRAFFIC
34 PLASTIC TRAFFIC LETTER
431.0000 EACH 75.0000 65.0000 -13.33% 125.0000 66.67 % 75.5000 0.67%
32,325.00 28,015.00  -4,310.00 53,875.00  21,550.00 32,540.50 215.50
35 PLASTIC DRAINAGE MARKING
288.0000 EACH 35.0000 35.0000 0.00% 43.0000 22.86 % 41.1000 17.43%
10,080.00 10,080.00 0.00 12,384.00 2,304.00 11,836.80 1,756.80
36 CENTERLINE RUMBLE STRIP
21.6000 MI. 1,365.0000 1,200.0000 -12.09% 1,100.0000 -19.41% 1,300.0000 —4.76%
29,484.00 25,920.00  -3,564.00 23,760.00  -5,724.00 28,080.00  -1,404.00
37 SHOULDER RUMBLE STRIP TYPE 4
1.9000 MI. 3,850.0000 3,000.0000 ~22.08% 2,520.0000 -34.55% 3,080.0000 -20.00%
7,315.00 5,700.00  -1,615.00 4,788.00  -2,527.00 5,852.00  -1,463.00
38 RAISED PAVEMENT MARKER TYPE 2
34.0000 HUND 495.0000 400.0000 ~19.19% 555.0000 12.12 % 480.0000 -3.03%
16,830.00 13,600.00  -3,230.00 18,870.00 2,040.00 16,320.00 -510.00
39 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING-SHORT DURATION
380400.0000 L.F. 0.4200 0.4500 7.14% 0.3000 -28.57% 0.1800 -57.14%
159,768.00 171,180.00  11,412.00 114,120.00 -45,648.00 68,472.00 -91,296.00
40 TRAFFIC SIGNAL SYSTEM SAB 1154
L.S. -39.67% -3.77% 17.73%
54,700.00 33,000.00 -21,700.00 52,640.00  -2,060.00 64,400.00 9,700.00
41 TEMPORARY VIDEO DETECTION SYSTEM SAB 1154
L.S. 0.00% -10.40 % 9.00%
10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 8,960.00  -1,040.00 10,900.00 900.00
42 TRAFFIC SIGNAL SYSTEM SAB 4486
L.S. -37.38% -23.49% -6.45%
52,700.00 33,000.00 -19,700.00 40,320.00 -12,380.00 49,300.00  -3,400.00
43 TEMPORARY VIDEO DETECTION SYSTEM SAB 4486
L.S. 0.00% -10.40 % 10.00%
10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 8,960.00  -1,040.00 11,000.00 1,000.00
44 TRAFFIC SIGNAL SYSTEM SAB 4648
L.S. -50.75% -16.42 % 2.24%
67,000.00 33,000.00 -34,000.00 56,000.00 -11,000.00 68,500.00 1,500.00
45 TEMPORARY VIDEO DETECTION SYSTEM SAB 4648
L.S. 0.00% 68.00 % 105.50 %
10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 16,800.00 6,800.00 20,550.00  10,550.00
46 TRAFFIC SIGNAL SYSTEM SAB 4606
L.S. -52_59% -35.63% -21.26%
69,600.00 33,000.00 -36,600.00 44,800.00 -24,800.00 54,800.00 -14,800.00
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 11/02/2016
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 07:08
PS&E JOB NO : 16A011 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : Nov 16 2016
CONTRACT NO : 008975 REGION NO i1 AWARDED ON : Nov 22 2016
VERSION NO :4 WORK ORDER# : XL4897
Y “SR 020,525 e LOW BIDDER  ————-—— —————n 2ND BIDDER  ————-—— ——————o 3RD BIDDER  —--——--
TITLE SR 20 AND SR 525 GRANITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY  CEMEX CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS  LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES, INC.
EgslﬁéLgRiéZH RD TO HOLBROOK RD 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE 20700 44TH AVE W SUITE 240 11497 HAVEKOST RD
164011 LYNNWOOD, WA 98036-7735 98221-8798
PROJECT -, NHPP-9999(753) EVERETT WA 982011927 EVERETT WA 982030037 ANACORTES WA 982210729
COUNTY(S) : ISLAND CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100102 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 044002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 469025
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
TRAFFIC
47 TEMPORARY VIDEO DETECTION SYSTEM SAB 4606
L.S. 0.00% -4.80% 16.00%
10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 9,520.00 -480.00 11,600.00 1,600.00
48 TRAFFIC SIGNAL SYSTEM SAB 1520
L.S. -46.69% -16.77 % 1.78%
61,900.00 33,000.00 -28,900.00 51,520.00 -10,380.00 63,000.00 1,100.00
49 TEMPORARY VIDEO DETECTION SYSTEM SAB 1520
L.S. 0.00% 12.00 % 29.00%
10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 11,200.00 1,200.00 12,900.00 2,900.00
50 PROJECT TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL
L.S. 30.76% -11.56 % 129.78%
1,153,274.00 1,508,000.00 354,726.00 1,020,000.00 -133,274.00 2,650,000.00 1,496,726.00
51 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A
24240000 S.F. 28.0000 21.0000 -25.00% 21.0000 -25.00 % 25.0000 -10.71%
67,872.00 50,904.00 -16,968.00 50,904.00 -16,968.00 60,600.00 -7,272.00
52 PLASTIC CROSSHATCH MARKING
4140.0000 L.F. 6.2500 8.0000 28.00% 4.2000 -32.80% 10.0000 60.00%
25,875.00 33,120.00 7,245.00 17,388.00 -8,487.00 41,400.00 15,525.00
OTHER ITEMS
53 TYPE B PROGRESS SCHEDULE
L.S. 0.00% 0.00 % 37.00%
10,000.00 10,000.00 0.00 10,000.00 0.00 13,700.00 3,700.00
54 ADJUST MONUMENT CASE AND COVER
108.0000 EACH 445.0000 150.0000 -66.29% 500.0000 12.36 % 620.0000 39.33%
48,060.00 16,200.00 -31,860.00 54,000.00 5,940.00 66,960.00 18,900.00
55 CEMENT CONC. SIDEWALK
401.0000 S.Y. 55.0000 105.0000 90.91% 90.0000 63.64 % 103.0000 87.27%
22,055.00 42,105.00 20,050.00 36,090.00 14,035.00 41,303.00 19,248.00
56 CEMENT CONC. CURB RAMP TYPE PARALLEL A
10.0000 EACH 2,200.0000 2,500.0000 13.64% 2,300.0000 4.55% 2,550.0000 15.91%
22,000.00 25,000.00 3,000.00 23,000.00 1,000.00 25,500.00 3,500.00
57 CEMENT CONC. CURB RAMP TYPE PERPENDICULAR A
12.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 2,200.0000 10.00 % 2,300.0000 15.00 % 2,200.0000 10.00%
24,000.00 26,400.00 2,400.00 27,600.00 3,600.00 26,400.00 2,400.00
58 CEMENT CONC. CURB RAMP TYPE PARALLEL MODIFIED
3.0000 EACH 3,000.0000 4,000.0000 33.33% 2,300.0000 -23.33% 4,075.0000 35.83%
9,000.00 12,000.00 3,000.00 6,900.00 -2,100.00 12,225.00 3,225.00
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DATE: 11/02/2016

* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 07:08
PS&E JOB NO : 16A011 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : Nov 16 2016
CONTRACT NO : 008975 REGION NO i1 AWARDED ON : Nov 22 2016
VERSION NO :4 WORK ORDER# : XL4897
Y “SR 020,525 e LOW BIDDER  ————-—— —————n 2ND BIDDER  ————-—— ——————o 3RD BIDDER  —--——--
TITLE SR 20 AND SR 525 GRANITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY  CEMEX CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS  LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES, INC.
BOB GALBREATH RD TO HOLBROOK RD 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE 20700 44TH AVE W SUITE 240 11497 HAVEKOST RD
EQXC'JTE & ADA LYNNWOOD, WA 98036-7735 98221-8798
PROJECT -, NHPP-9999(753) EVERETT WA 982011927 EVERETT WA 982030037 ANACORTES WA 982210729
COUNTY(S) : ISLAND CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100102 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 044002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 469025
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
OTHER ITEMS
59 FORCE ACCOUNT CAP WELL
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
100.00 100.00 100.00 100.00
60 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
61 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00
62 MINOR CHANGE
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00 -1.00
63 AGGREGATE COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00%
-12.00 -12.00 -12.00 -12.00
64 SPCC PLAN
L.S. -80.00% -90.00 % -58.90%
5,000.00 1,000.00 -4,000.00 500.00 -4,500.00 2,055.00 -2,945.00
65 REFERENCING EXISTING PAVEMENT MARKINGS
L.S. 49.81% 14.86 % 39.83%
40,050.00 60,000.00 19,950.00 46,000.00 5,950.00 56,000.00 15,950.00
BASE TOTAL $5,930,357.40 $6,451,879.80 8.79% $6,448,823.80 8.74% $8,233,394.00 38.83%
ALTERNATE Al
66 HMA FOR PAVEMENT REPAIR CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-22
4101.0000 TON 135.0000 105.0000 -22.22% 115.0000 -14.81% 188.0000 39.26%
553,635.00 430,605.00 -123,030.00 471,615.00 -82,020.00 770,988.00 217,353.00
67 HMA CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-22
53680.0000 TON 77.0000 86.0000 11.69% 93.0000 20.78 % 100.0000 29.87%
4,133,360.00 4,616,480.00 483,120.00 4,992,240.00 858,880.00 5,368,000.00 1,234,640.00
68 HMA FOR APPROACH CL. 1/2 IN. PG 64-22
2260.0000 TON 125.0000 155.0000 24.00% 111.0000 -11.20% 194.5000 55.60%
282,500.00 350,300.00 67,800.00 250,860.00 -31,640.00 439,570.00 157,070.00
ALTERNATE Al TOTAL $4,969,495.00 $5,397,385.00 8.61% $5,714,715.00 15.00% $6,578,558.00 32.38%
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DOT_RGGBO1 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION DATE: 11/02/2016
* % * BID CHECK REPORT * * * TIME: 07:08
PS&E JOB NO : 16A011 REVISION NO BIDS OPENED ON : Nov 16 2016
CONTRACT NO : 008975 REGION NO i1 AWARDED ON : Nov 22 2016
VERSION NO :4 WORK ORDER# : XL4897
Y “SR 020,525 e LOW BIDDER  ————-—— —————n 2ND BIDDER  ————-—— ——————o 3RD BIDDER  —--——--
TITLE SR 20 AND SR 525 GRANITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY  CEMEX CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS  LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES, INC.
E/?\EjlﬁéLSRﬁE\é/IH RD TO HOLBROOK RD 1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE 20700 44TH AVE W SUITE 240 11497 HAVEKOST RD
164011 LYNNWOOD, WA 98036-7735 98221-8798
PROJECT -, NHPP-9999(753) EVERETT WA 982011927 EVERETT WA 982030037 ANACORTES WA 982210729
COUNTY(S) : ISLAND CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100102 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 044002 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 469025
ENGR"S. EST.
ITEM ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
NO. EST. QUANTITY MEAS TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.
ALTERNATE A2
69 HMA FOR PAVEMENT REPAIR CL. 3/8 IN. PG 64-22
4101.0000 TON 135.0000 0.0000 -100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 %
553,635.00 0.00 -553,635.00 0.00 -553,635.00 0.00 -553,635.00
70 HMA CL. 3/8 IN. PG 64-22
53680.0000 TON 77.0000 0.0000 -100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 %
4,133,360.00 0.00 4,133,360.00 0.00 4,133,360.00 0.00 4,133,360.00
71 HMA FOR APPROACH CL. 3/8 IN. PG 64-22
2260.0000 TON 125.0000 0.0000 -100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 % 0.0000 -100.00 %
282,500.00 0.00 -282,500.00 0.00 -282,500.00 0.00 -282,500.00

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL

BASE TOTAL
BASE + Al CONTRACT TOTAL (A)
BASE + A2 CONTRACT TOTAL (A)

$4,969,495.00

$5,930,357.40

$10,899,852.40

$10,899,852.40

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

$6,451,879.80 8.79%

$11,849,264.80 8.71%

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

$6,448,823.80 8.74%

$12,163,538.80 11.59%

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

$8,233,394.00 38.83%

$14,811,952.00 35.89%

NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
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CONTRACT NO: 008975 * * *  RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT  * * = Nov 16 2016
TITLE: SR 20 AND SR 525 REGION: 1

BOB GALBREATH RD TO HOLBROOK RD
PAVING & ADA
16A011

HWY: SR 020,525

1 $11,849,264.80 BASE + Al GRANITE CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

1525 E. MARINE VIEW DRIVE
EVERETT, WA 982011927

2 $12,163,538.80 BASE + Al CEMEX CONSTRUCTION MATERIALS

PACIFIC, LLC

20700 44TH AVE W SUITE 240
LYNNWOOD, WA 98036-7735

PO BOX 2037

EVERETT, WA 982030037

3 $14,811,952.00 BASE + Al LAKESIDE INDUSTRIES, INC.
11497 HAVEKOST RD
98221-8798
PO BOX 729
ANACORTES, WA 982210729

8-A



