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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

ROSS BROS. & COMPANY, INC. WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. ONE WAY CONSTRUCTION, INC.
3501 BROOKLAKE RD. N. 2208 MAY LN 24635 HWY 20

PO BOX 428 98284-8012

PROJECT : SALEM   OR  973039721 LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SEDRO WOOLLEY   WA  982841173

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 708005 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 617975

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S. 53.57% 59.47 % 61.56 %
157,586.52 242,000.00 84,413 251,300.00 93,713 254,592.00 97,005

2  CLEARING
L.S. 126.24% -0.45 % 54.75 %

3,315.00 7,500.00 4,185 3,300.00 -15 5,130.00 1,815
3 CLEARING AND GRUBBING

L.S. 166.67% -24.44 % 98.00 %
2,250.00 6,000.00 3,750 1,700.00 -550 4,455.00 2,205

4 ARCHAEOLOGICAL AND PALEONTOLOGICAL SALVAGE
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
5 REMOVING EXISTING BRIDGE NO. 97/116

L.S. 40.00% 16.00 % 130.44 %
25,000.00 35,000.00 10,000 29,000.00 4,000 57,610.00 32,610

6 REMOVING GUARDRAIL
74.0000 m 6.5000 6.0000 -7.69% 14.0000 115.38 % 8.5000 30.77 %

481.00 444.00 -37 1,036.00 555 629.00 148
7 REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR

4.0000 EACH 150.0000 82.0000 -45.33% 187.0000 24.67 % 100.0000 -33.33 %
600.00 328.00 -272 748.00 148 400.00 -200

8 REMOVING TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
2360.0000 m 0.2500 0.3500 40.00% 0.3900 56.00 % 2.0000 700.00 %

590.00 826.00 236 920.40 330 4,720.00 4,130
9 REMOVING PAINT LINE

460.0000 m 1.6000 3.5000 118.75% 3.9000 143.75 % 2.9000 81.25 %
736.00 1,610.00 874 1,794.00 1,058 1,334.00 598

10 REMOVING MISCELLANEOUS TRAFFIC ITEM
L.S. 39.76% 260.36 % 350.45 %

111.00 155.13 44 400.00 289 500.00 389
GRADING

11 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL
1825.0000 m3 10.0000 11.0000 10.00% 11.0000 10.00 % 12.0000 20.00 %

18,250.00 20,075.00 1,825 20,075.00 1,825 21,900.00 3,650
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ENGR'S. EST.
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NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
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07/24/2001
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DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

GRADING
12 COMMON BORROW INCL. HAUL

3210.0000 m3 7.5000 17.0000 126.67% 12.7500 70.00 % 7.2000 -4.00 %
24,075.00 54,570.00 30,495 40,927.50 16,853 23,112.00 -963

13 GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL
19466.0000 t 6.0000 8.0000 33.33% 11.5000 91.67 % 11.6500 94.17 %

116,796.00 155,728.00 38,932 223,859.00 107,063 226,778.90 109,983
14 EMBANKMENT COMPACTION

12240.0000 m3 1.5000 1.6700 11.33% 4.5000 200.00 % 1.7500 16.67 %
18,360.00 20,440.80 2,081 55,080.00 36,720 21,420.00 3,060

15  DETOUR REMOVAL
6760.0000 m3 12.0000 6.0000 -50.00% 7.5000 -37.50 % 12.1000 0.83 %

81,120.00 40,560.00 -40,560 50,700.00 -30,420 81,796.00 676
DRAINAGE

16 GRATE INLET TYPE 2
2.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 909.1400 -54.54% 1,300.0000 -35.00 % 1,000.0000 -50.00 %

4,000.00 1,818.28 -2,182 2,600.00 -1,400 2,000.00 -2,000
17 FILTER BLANKET

160.0000 m3 14.0000 34.2900 144.93% 33.0000 135.71 % 20.0000 42.86 %
2,240.00 5,486.40 3,246 5,280.00 3,040 3,200.00 960

18 LIGHT LOOSE RIPRAP
589.0000 m3 40.0000 56.0000 40.00% 44.5000 11.25 % 28.7500 -28.13 %

23,560.00 32,984.00 9,424 26,210.50 2,651 16,933.75 -6,626
19  MODIFIED HEAVY LOOSE RIP RAP

26.0000 m3 50.0000 56.5900 13.18% 24.0000 -52.00 % 50.0000 0.00 %
1,300.00 1,471.34 171 624.00 -676 1,300.00 0

20 DRAIN PIPE 300 MM DIAM.
14.0000 m 80.0000 95.0000 18.75% 140.0000 75.00 % 60.0000 -25.00 %

1,120.00 1,330.00 210 1,960.00 840 840.00 -280
21  3.66M X 1.83M PRECAST REINF. CONC. BOX CULVERT

151.2000 m 2,200.0000 2,300.0000 4.55% 2,150.0000 -2.27 % 2,847.6500 29.44 %
332,640.00 347,760.00 15,120 325,080.00 -7,560 430,564.68 97,925

22  1.83M X 0.91M PRECAST REINF. CONC. BOX CULVERT
25.6000 m 1,100.0000 1,100.0000 0.00% 825.0000 -25.00 % 1,116.1000 1.46 %

28,160.00 28,160.00 0 21,120.00 -7,040 28,572.16 412
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STRUCTURE
23 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL

81.0000 m3 30.0000 14.0000 -53.33% 12.0000 -60.00 % 20.0000 -33.33 %
2,430.00 1,134.00 -1,296 972.00 -1,458 1,620.00 -810

24 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A
L.S. -60.00% -33.33 % -90.00 %

15,000.00 6,000.00 -9,000 10,000.00 -5,000 1,500.00 -13,500
25  SOIL EXCAVATION FOR SHAFT INCLUDING HAUL

289.0000 m3 250.0000 450.0000 80.00% 425.0000 70.00 % 543.4000 117.36 %
72,250.00 130,050.00 57,800 122,825.00 50,575 157,042.60 84,793

26  FURNISHING & PLACING TEMP. CASING FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT
15.0000 m 300.0000 100.0000 -66.67% 135.0000 -55.00 % 130.0000 -56.67 %

4,500.00 1,500.00 -3,000 2,025.00 -2,475 1,950.00 -2,550
27  FURNISHING PERMANENT CASING FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT

15.0000 m 400.0000 300.0000 -25.00% 135.0000 -66.25 % 390.0000 -2.50 %
6,000.00 4,500.00 -1,500 2,025.00 -3,975 5,850.00 -150

28  PLACING PERMANENT CASING FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT
4.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 2,500.0000 150.00% 350.0000 -65.00 % 2,600.0000 160.00 %

4,000.00 10,000.00 6,000 1,400.00 -2,600 10,400.00 6,400
29  CASING SHORING

3.0000 m 400.0000 100.0000 -75.00% 135.0000 -66.25 % 130.0000 -67.50 %
1,200.00 300.00 -900 405.00 -795 390.00 -810

30  SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT
L.S. -50.00% -87.50 % -85.00 %

8,000.00 4,000.00 -4,000 1,000.00 -7,000 1,200.00 -6,800
31  CONC. CLASS 28P FOR SHAFT

289.0000 m3 200.0000 260.0000 30.00% 110.0000 -45.00 % 195.0000 -2.50 %
57,800.00 75,140.00 17,340 31,790.00 -26,010 56,355.00 -1,445

32  ST. REINF. BAR FOR SHAFT
36660.0000 kg 1.1000 1.1200 1.82% 1.0000 -9.09 % 1.2000 9.09 %

40,326.00 41,059.20 733 36,660.00 -3,666 43,992.00 3,666
33  CSL ACCESS TUBE

455.0000 m 8.0000 12.0000 50.00% 6.0000 -25.00 % 18.6800 133.50 %
3,640.00 5,460.00 1,820 2,730.00 -910 8,499.40 4,859

34  REMOVING OBSTRUCTIONS
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
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 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

STRUCTURE
35 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT

CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %
1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00

36 ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE
14240.0000 kg 1.1000 1.1900 8.18% 1.0000 -9.09 % 1.2000 9.09 %

15,664.00 16,945.60 1,282 14,240.00 -1,424 17,088.00 1,424
37 CONC. CLASS 28 FOR BRIDGE

184.0000 m3 500.0000 350.0000 -30.00% 375.0000 -25.00 % 312.5000 -37.50 %
92,000.00 64,400.00 -27,600 69,000.00 -23,000 57,500.00 -34,500

38 SUPERSTRUCTURE BRIDGE NO. 97/116
L.S. -5.85% 4.49 % 43.90 %

325,000.00 306,000.00 -19,000 339,600.00 14,600 467,671.50 142,672
SURFACING

39 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE
5892.0000 t 12.0000 10.0000 -16.67% 14.0000 16.67 % 15.2000 26.67 %

70,704.00 58,920.00 -11,784 82,488.00 11,784 89,558.40 18,854
LIQUID ASPHALT

40 ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

9,970.00 9,970.00 9,970.00 9,970.00
CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

41 BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB
237.6000 m2 150.0000 200.0000 33.33% 180.0000 20.00 % 170.0000 13.33 %

35,640.00 47,520.00 11,880 42,768.00 7,128 40,392.00 4,752
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

42 CRACK SEALING
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

2,800.00 2,800.00 2,800.00 2,800.00
43 PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT

407.0000 m2 15.0000 7.7800 -48.13% 14.7500 -1.67 % 15.3500 2.33 %
6,105.00 3,166.46 -2,939 6,003.25 -102 6,247.45 142

44 ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT CL. A PG 64-28
9970.0000 t 31.0000 39.6000 27.74% 39.6000 27.74 % 41.6000 34.19 %

309,070.00 394,812.00 85,742 394,812.00 85,742 414,752.00 105,682
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ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT
45 JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT

CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %
9,273.00 9,273.00 9,273.00 9,273.00

46 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

4,410.00 4,410.00 4,410.00 4,410.00
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING

47 SEEDING
0.9300 ha 2,500.0000 973.5100 -61.06% 1,016.0000 -59.36 % 3,000.0000 20.00 %

2,325.00 905.36 -1,420 944.88 -1,380 2,790.00 465
48 MULCHING

0.9300 ha 2,000.0000 1,977.6000 -1.12% 2,062.0000 3.10 % 3,000.0000 50.00 %
1,860.00 1,839.17 -21 1,917.66 58 2,790.00 930

49  LOG WITH ROOT WAD
3.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 250.0000 -75.00% 600.0000 -40.00 % 500.0000 -50.00 %

3,000.00 750.00 -2,250 1,800.00 -1,200 1,500.00 -1,500
50  STRAW BALE SEDIMENT POND

150.0000 m 40.0000 31.5100 -21.23% 20.0000 -50.00 % 15.0000 -62.50 %
6,000.00 4,726.50 -1,274 3,000.00 -3,000 2,250.00 -3,750

51  BANK REVEGETATION
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

1,845.00 1,845.00 1,845.00 1,845.00
TRAFFIC

52 EXTRUDED CURB
27.0000 m 20.0000 33.3300 66.65% 52.0000 160.00 % 110.0000 450.00 %

540.00 899.91 360 1,404.00 864 2,970.00 2,430
53 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1

810.0000 m 38.0000 39.5000 3.95% 43.0000 13.16 % 39.7000 4.47 %
30,780.00 31,995.00 1,215 34,830.00 4,050 32,157.00 1,377

54 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1 - 2.4 M LONG POST
937.0000 m 45.0000 43.2500 -3.89% 47.0000 4.44 % 48.2000 7.11 %

42,165.00 40,525.25 -1,640 44,039.00 1,874 45,163.40 2,998
55 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1

4.0000 EACH 1,300.0000 1,350.0000 3.85% 1,500.0000 15.38 % 1,155.0000 -11.15 %
5,200.00 5,400.00 200 6,000.00 800 4,620.00 -580
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TRAFFIC
56 BEAM GUARDRAIL NON-FLARED TERMINAL

7.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 1,850.0000 -7.50% 2,150.0000 7.50 % 2,205.0000 10.25 %
14,000.00 12,950.00 -1,050 15,050.00 1,050 15,435.00 1,435

57 BEAM GUARDRAIL ANCHOR TYPE 1
1.0000 EACH 450.0000 500.0000 11.11% 553.0000 22.89 % 525.0000 16.67 %

450.00 500.00 50 553.00 103 525.00 75
58 TEMPORARY CONC. BARRIER

2919.0000 m 35.0000 65.0000 85.71% 50.0000 42.86 % 50.0000 42.86 %
102,165.00 189,735.00 87,570 145,950.00 43,785 145,950.00 43,785

59 FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST
69.0000 EACH 20.0000 25.0000 25.00% 24.0000 20.00 % 21.6000 8.00 %

1,380.00 1,725.00 345 1,656.00 276 1,490.40 110
60 PAINT LINE

2670.0000 m 0.4500 0.3500 -22.22% 0.3600 -20.00 % 1.1000 144.44 %
1,201.50 934.50 -267 961.20 -240 2,937.00 1,736

61 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
6222.0000 m 0.1800 0.3000 66.67% 0.3100 72.22 % 0.7000 288.89 %

1,119.96 1,866.60 747 1,928.82 809 4,355.40 3,235
62 PERMANENT SIGNING

L.S. 21.67% 26.67 % -33.33 %
3,000.00 3,650.00 650 3,800.00 800 2,000.00 -1,000

63 ILLUMINATION SYSTEM REVISION
L.S. 64.06% 71.88 % 165.63 %

3,200.00 5,250.00 2,050 5,500.00 2,300 8,500.00 5,300
64 PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN

2.0000 EACH 1,500.0000 9,450.0000 530.00% 9,855.0000 557.00 % 15,000.0000 900.00 %
3,000.00 18,900.00 15,900 19,710.00 16,710 30,000.00 27,000

65 OPERATION OF PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN
8160.0000 HR 3.5000 1.2500 -64.29% 1.3000 -62.86 % 1.0000 -71.43 %

28,560.00 10,200.00 -18,360 10,608.00 -17,952 8,160.00 -20,400
66 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES

L.S. -47.79% -45.70 % -58.23 %
4,788.00 2,500.00 -2,288 2,600.00 -2,188 2,000.00 -2,788

67 TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR
3140.0000 HR 31.0000 31.2500 0.81% 32.6000 5.16 % 32.0000 3.23 %

97,340.00 98,125.00 785 102,364.00 5,024 100,480.00 3,140
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TRAFFIC
68 TRAFFIC CONTROL VEHICLE

100.0000 DAY 65.0000 45.0000 -30.77% 47.0000 -27.69 % 35.0000 -46.15 %
6,500.00 4,500.00 -2,000 4,700.00 -1,800 3,500.00 -3,000

69 TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR
1700.0000 HR 33.0000 33.5000 1.52% 35.0000 6.06 % 35.0000 6.06 %

56,100.00 56,950.00 850 59,500.00 3,400 59,500.00 3,400
70 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A

28.3500 m2 110.0000 75.0000 -31.82% 78.5000 -28.64 % 110.0000 0.00 %
3,118.50 2,126.25 -992 2,225.48 -893 3,118.50 0

OTHER ITEMS
71 DELETED ITEM

0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00 % 0.0000 0.00 %
0.00 0.00 0 0.00 0 0.00 0

72 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00 % 0.0000 0.00 %

0.00 0.00 0 0.00 0 0.00 0
73 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL

2498.0000 m3 8.0000 8.0000 0.00% 10.0000 25.00 % 10.0000 25.00 %
19,984.00 19,984.00 0 24,980.00 4,996 24,980.00 4,996

74 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CLASS B
925.0000 m2 6.0000 20.0000 233.33% 51.0000 750.00 % 4.0000 -33.33 %

5,550.00 18,500.00 12,950 47,175.00 41,625 3,700.00 -1,850
75  FOUNDATION MATERIAL CLASS B

355.0000 m3 20.0000 15.0000 -25.00% 44.5000 122.50 % 25.7000 28.50 %
7,100.00 5,325.00 -1,775 15,797.50 8,698 9,123.50 2,024

76 TRAINING
1000.0000 HR 2.0000 1.0000 -50.00% 2.0000 0.00 % 5.0000 150.00 %

2,000.00 1,000.00 -1,000 2,000.00 0 5,000.00 3,000
77 STRUCTURE SURVEYING

L.S. 316.67% 205.56 % 66.67 %
7,200.00 30,000.00 22,800 22,000.00 14,800 12,000.00 4,800

78 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

ROSS BROS. & COMPANY, INC. WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. ONE WAY CONSTRUCTION, INC.
3501 BROOKLAKE RD. N. 2208 MAY LN 24635 HWY 20

PO BOX 428 98284-8012

PROJECT : SALEM   OR  973039721 LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SEDRO WOOLLEY   WA  982841173

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 708005 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 617975

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

OTHER ITEMS
79 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE

EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %
5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

80 MINOR CHANGE
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
81 SPILL PREVENTION PLAN

L.S. -21.44% -64.00 % -60.00 %
1,250.00 982.00 -268 450.00 -800 500.00 -750

82 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR SEPARATION
4435.0000 m2 3.0000 1.3400 -55.33% 1.6000 -46.67 % 1.6000 -46.67 %

13,305.00 5,942.90 -7,362 7,096.00 -6,209 7,096.00 -6,209
83 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR TEMPORARY SILT FENCE

1460.0000 m 10.0000 4.7000 -53.00% 12.2500 22.50 % 11.5000 15.00 %
14,600.00 6,862.00 -7,738 17,885.00 3,285 16,790.00 2,190

84 TEMPORARY GEOSYNTHETIC RETAINING WALL
437.0000 m2 110.0000 50.0000 -54.55% 82.0000 -25.45 % 60.0000 -45.45 %

48,070.00 21,850.00 -26,220 35,834.00 -12,236 26,220.00 -21,850

BASE TOTAL $2,502,777.48 $2,836,859.65 13.35% $2,923,023.19 16.79 % $3,211,703.04 28.33 %
ALTERNATE A1

85  TEMPORARY BRIDGE - A1
L.S. -100.00% -34.55 % -50.76 %

275,000.00 0.00 -275,000 180,000.00 -95,000 135,400.00 -139,600

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL $275,000.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $180,000.00 -34.55 % $135,400.00 -50.76 %
ALTERNATE A2

86  TEMPORARY BRIDGE - A2
L.S. -26.67% -20.00 % -100.00 %

225,000.00 165,000.00 -60,000 180,000.00 -45,000 0.00 -225,000

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $225,000.00 $165,000.00 -26.67% $180,000.00 -20.00 % NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

ROSS BROS. & COMPANY, INC. WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO. ONE WAY CONSTRUCTION, INC.
3501 BROOKLAKE RD. N. 2208 MAY LN 24635 HWY 20

PO BOX 428 98284-8012

PROJECT : SALEM   OR  973039721 LAGRANDE   OR  978500428 SEDRO WOOLLEY   WA  982841173

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 708005 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 869910 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 617975

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

BASE + A1 TOTAL $2,777,777.48 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $3,103,023.19 11.71% $3,347,103.04 20.50%

BASE + A2 TOTAL $2,727,777.48 $3,001,859.65 10.05% $3,103,023.19 13.76% NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

GOODFELLOW BROS., INC. JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE 123 SE 4TH 55 MT ADAMS HWY
98801-1530 97702-1357

PROJECT : WENATCHEE   WA  988070598 BEND   OR  977086269 GLENWOOD   WA  986199123

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100296 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100344 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100366

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S. 96.72% 42.78 % -100.00 %
157,586.52 310,000.00 152,413 225,000.00 67,413 0.00 -157,587

2  CLEARING
L.S. 50.83% 292.16 % 35.75 %

3,315.00 5,000.00 1,685 13,000.00 9,685 4,500.00 1,185
3 CLEARING AND GRUBBING

L.S. 122.22% 300.00 % 233.33 %
2,250.00 5,000.00 2,750 9,000.00 6,750 7,500.00 5,250

4 ARCHAEOLOGICAL AND PALEONTOLOGICAL SALVAGE
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
5 REMOVING EXISTING BRIDGE NO. 97/116

L.S. 12.00% 28.00 % 36.00 %
25,000.00 28,000.00 3,000 32,000.00 7,000 34,000.00 9,000

6 REMOVING GUARDRAIL
74.0000 m 6.5000 7.0000 7.69% 15.0000 130.77 % 8.0000 23.08 %

481.00 518.00 37 1,110.00 629 592.00 111
7 REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR

4.0000 EACH 150.0000 210.0000 40.00% 200.0000 33.33 % 250.0000 66.67 %
600.00 840.00 240 800.00 200 1,000.00 400

8 REMOVING TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
2360.0000 m 0.2500 0.5000 100.00% 0.4000 60.00 % 0.4000 60.00 %

590.00 1,180.00 590 944.00 354 944.00 354
9 REMOVING PAINT LINE

460.0000 m 1.6000 2.8000 75.00% 3.7000 131.25 % 3.0900 93.12 %
736.00 1,288.00 552 1,702.00 966 1,421.40 685

10 REMOVING MISCELLANEOUS TRAFFIC ITEM
L.S. 890.99% 800.90 % 350.45 %

111.00 1,100.00 989 1,000.00 889 500.00 389
GRADING

11 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL
1825.0000 m3 10.0000 11.0000 10.00% 13.6000 36.00 % 24.0000 140.00 %

18,250.00 20,075.00 1,825 24,820.00 6,570 43,800.00 25,550
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

GOODFELLOW BROS., INC. JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE 123 SE 4TH 55 MT ADAMS HWY
98801-1530 97702-1357

PROJECT : WENATCHEE   WA  988070598 BEND   OR  977086269 GLENWOOD   WA  986199123

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100296 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100344 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100366

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

GRADING
12 COMMON BORROW INCL. HAUL

3210.0000 m3 7.5000 13.0000 73.33% 15.0000 100.00 % 9.8500 31.33 %
24,075.00 41,730.00 17,655 48,150.00 24,075 31,618.50 7,544

13 GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL
19466.0000 t 6.0000 11.0000 83.33% 7.5000 25.00 % 11.4000 90.00 %

116,796.00 214,126.00 97,330 145,995.00 29,199 221,912.40 105,116
14 EMBANKMENT COMPACTION

12240.0000 m3 1.5000 1.0000 -33.33% 6.5000 333.33 % 4.2000 180.00 %
18,360.00 12,240.00 -6,120 79,560.00 61,200 51,408.00 33,048

15  DETOUR REMOVAL
6760.0000 m3 12.0000 6.0000 -50.00% 5.5000 -54.17 % 6.5000 -45.83 %

81,120.00 40,560.00 -40,560 37,180.00 -43,940 43,940.00 -37,180
DRAINAGE

16 GRATE INLET TYPE 2
2.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 2,400.0000 20.00% 1,000.0000 -50.00 % 3,000.0000 50.00 %

4,000.00 4,800.00 800 2,000.00 -2,000 6,000.00 2,000
17 FILTER BLANKET

160.0000 m3 14.0000 40.0000 185.71% 25.0000 78.57 % 55.0000 292.86 %
2,240.00 6,400.00 4,160 4,000.00 1,760 8,800.00 6,560

18 LIGHT LOOSE RIPRAP
589.0000 m3 40.0000 40.0000 0.00% 30.0000 -25.00 % 40.0000 0.00 %

23,560.00 23,560.00 0 17,670.00 -5,890 23,560.00 0
19  MODIFIED HEAVY LOOSE RIP RAP

26.0000 m3 50.0000 65.0000 30.00% 45.0000 -10.00 % 60.0000 20.00 %
1,300.00 1,690.00 390 1,170.00 -130 1,560.00 260

20 DRAIN PIPE 300 MM DIAM.
14.0000 m 80.0000 120.0000 50.00% 70.0000 -12.50 % 96.0000 20.00 %

1,120.00 1,680.00 560 980.00 -140 1,344.00 224
21  3.66M X 1.83M PRECAST REINF. CONC. BOX CULVERT

151.2000 m 2,200.0000 2,600.0000 18.18% 2,816.0000 28.00 % 4,222.0000 91.91 %
332,640.00 393,120.00 60,480 425,779.20 93,139 638,366.40 305,726

22  1.83M X 0.91M PRECAST REINF. CONC. BOX CULVERT
25.6000 m 1,100.0000 1,200.0000 9.09% 960.0000 -12.73 % 2,500.0000 127.27 %

28,160.00 30,720.00 2,560 24,576.00 -3,584 64,000.00 35,840
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

GOODFELLOW BROS., INC. JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE 123 SE 4TH 55 MT ADAMS HWY
98801-1530 97702-1357

PROJECT : WENATCHEE   WA  988070598 BEND   OR  977086269 GLENWOOD   WA  986199123

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100296 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100344 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100366

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

STRUCTURE
23 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL

81.0000 m3 30.0000 50.0000 66.67% 25.0000 -16.67 % 40.0000 33.33 %
2,430.00 4,050.00 1,620 2,025.00 -405 3,240.00 810

24 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A
L.S. -20.00% 33.33 % -99.99 %

15,000.00 12,000.00 -3,000 20,000.00 5,000 1.00 -14,999
25  SOIL EXCAVATION FOR SHAFT INCLUDING HAUL

289.0000 m3 250.0000 425.0000 70.00% 470.0000 88.00 % 500.0000 100.00 %
72,250.00 122,825.00 50,575 135,830.00 63,580 144,500.00 72,250

26  FURNISHING & PLACING TEMP. CASING FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT
15.0000 m 300.0000 135.0000 -55.00% 110.0000 -63.33 % 120.0000 -60.00 %

4,500.00 2,025.00 -2,475 1,650.00 -2,850 1,800.00 -2,700
27  FURNISHING PERMANENT CASING FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT

15.0000 m 400.0000 135.0000 -66.25% 330.0000 -17.50 % 360.0000 -10.00 %
6,000.00 2,025.00 -3,975 4,950.00 -1,050 5,400.00 -600

28  PLACING PERMANENT CASING FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT
4.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 350.0000 -65.00% 2,500.0000 150.00 % 2,000.0000 100.00 %

4,000.00 1,400.00 -2,600 10,000.00 6,000 8,000.00 4,000
29  CASING SHORING

3.0000 m 400.0000 135.0000 -66.25% 110.0000 -72.50 % 150.0000 -62.50 %
1,200.00 405.00 -795 330.00 -870 450.00 -750

30  SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT
L.S. -75.00% -87.50 % -87.50 %

8,000.00 2,000.00 -6,000 1,000.00 -7,000 1,000.00 -7,000
31  CONC. CLASS 28P FOR SHAFT

289.0000 m3 200.0000 120.0000 -40.00% 170.0000 -15.00 % 180.0000 -10.00 %
57,800.00 34,680.00 -23,120 49,130.00 -8,670 52,020.00 -5,780

32  ST. REINF. BAR FOR SHAFT
36660.0000 kg 1.1000 1.1000 0.00% 1.5000 36.36 % 1.2000 9.09 %

40,326.00 40,326.00 0 54,990.00 14,664 43,992.00 3,666
33  CSL ACCESS TUBE

455.0000 m 8.0000 12.0000 50.00% 10.0000 25.00 % 12.0000 50.00 %
3,640.00 5,460.00 1,820 4,550.00 910 5,460.00 1,820

34  REMOVING OBSTRUCTIONS
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00 20,000.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

GOODFELLOW BROS., INC. JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE 123 SE 4TH 55 MT ADAMS HWY
98801-1530 97702-1357

PROJECT : WENATCHEE   WA  988070598 BEND   OR  977086269 GLENWOOD   WA  986199123

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100296 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100344 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100366

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

STRUCTURE
35 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT

CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %
1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00

36 ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE
14240.0000 kg 1.1000 1.1000 0.00% 1.2000 9.09 % 1.2000 9.09 %

15,664.00 15,664.00 0 17,088.00 1,424 17,088.00 1,424
37 CONC. CLASS 28 FOR BRIDGE

184.0000 m3 500.0000 350.0000 -30.00% 400.0000 -20.00 % 440.0000 -12.00 %
92,000.00 64,400.00 -27,600 73,600.00 -18,400 80,960.00 -11,040

38 SUPERSTRUCTURE BRIDGE NO. 97/116
L.S. 16.92% 74.46 % 76.92 %

325,000.00 380,000.00 55,000 567,000.00 242,000 575,000.00 250,000
SURFACING

39 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE
5892.0000 t 12.0000 11.0000 -8.33% 12.0000 0.00 % 13.9000 15.83 %

70,704.00 64,812.00 -5,892 70,704.00 0 81,898.80 11,195
LIQUID ASPHALT

40 ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

9,970.00 9,970.00 9,970.00 9,970.00
CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

41 BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB
237.6000 m2 150.0000 250.0000 66.67% 130.0000 -13.33 % 140.0000 -6.67 %

35,640.00 59,400.00 23,760 30,888.00 -4,752 33,264.00 -2,376
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

42 CRACK SEALING
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

2,800.00 2,800.00 2,800.00 2,800.00
43 PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT

407.0000 m2 15.0000 11.0000 -26.67% 16.0000 6.67 % 9.0000 -40.00 %
6,105.00 4,477.00 -1,628 6,512.00 407 3,663.00 -2,442

44 ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT CL. A PG 64-28
9970.0000 t 31.0000 39.0000 25.81% 42.0000 35.48 % 46.0000 48.39 %

309,070.00 388,830.00 79,760 418,740.00 109,670 458,620.00 149,550
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

GOODFELLOW BROS., INC. JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE 123 SE 4TH 55 MT ADAMS HWY
98801-1530 97702-1357

PROJECT : WENATCHEE   WA  988070598 BEND   OR  977086269 GLENWOOD   WA  986199123

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100296 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100344 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100366

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT
45 JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT

CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %
9,273.00 9,273.00 9,273.00 9,273.00

46 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

4,410.00 4,410.00 4,410.00 4,410.00
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING

47 SEEDING
0.9300 ha 2,500.0000 1,500.0000 -40.00% 1,600.0000 -36.00 % 1,700.0000 -32.00 %

2,325.00 1,395.00 -930 1,488.00 -837 1,581.00 -744
48 MULCHING

0.9300 ha 2,000.0000 1,500.0000 -25.00% 1,600.0000 -20.00 % 1,700.0000 -15.00 %
1,860.00 1,395.00 -465 1,488.00 -372 1,581.00 -279

49  LOG WITH ROOT WAD
3.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 2,200.0000 120.00% 1,800.0000 80.00 % 250.0000 -75.00 %

3,000.00 6,600.00 3,600 5,400.00 2,400 750.00 -2,250
50  STRAW BALE SEDIMENT POND

150.0000 m 40.0000 50.0000 25.00% 15.0000 -62.50 % 40.0000 0.00 %
6,000.00 7,500.00 1,500 2,250.00 -3,750 6,000.00 0

51  BANK REVEGETATION
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

1,845.00 1,845.00 1,845.00 1,845.00
TRAFFIC

52 EXTRUDED CURB
27.0000 m 20.0000 23.0000 15.00% 30.0000 50.00 % 60.0000 200.00 %

540.00 621.00 81 810.00 270 1,620.00 1,080
53 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1

810.0000 m 38.0000 38.0000 0.00% 42.7000 12.37 % 46.8100 23.18 %
30,780.00 30,780.00 0 34,587.00 3,807 37,916.10 7,136

54 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1 - 2.4 M LONG POST
937.0000 m 45.0000 46.0000 2.22% 47.0000 4.44 % 51.3500 14.11 %

42,165.00 43,102.00 937 44,039.00 1,874 48,114.95 5,950
55 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1

4.0000 EACH 1,300.0000 1,100.0000 -15.38% 1,500.0000 15.38 % 1,610.0000 23.85 %
5,200.00 4,400.00 -800 6,000.00 800 6,440.00 1,240
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

GOODFELLOW BROS., INC. JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE 123 SE 4TH 55 MT ADAMS HWY
98801-1530 97702-1357

PROJECT : WENATCHEE   WA  988070598 BEND   OR  977086269 GLENWOOD   WA  986199123

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100296 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100344 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100366

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

TRAFFIC
56 BEAM GUARDRAIL NON-FLARED TERMINAL

7.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 2,100.0000 5.00% 2,121.0000 6.05 % 2,360.0000 18.00 %
14,000.00 14,700.00 700 14,847.00 847 16,520.00 2,520

57 BEAM GUARDRAIL ANCHOR TYPE 1
1.0000 EACH 450.0000 500.0000 11.11% 556.0000 23.56 % 610.0000 35.56 %

450.00 500.00 50 556.00 106 610.00 160
58 TEMPORARY CONC. BARRIER

2919.0000 m 35.0000 60.0000 71.43% 55.0000 57.14 % 55.0000 57.14 %
102,165.00 175,140.00 72,975 160,545.00 58,380 160,545.00 58,380

59 FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST
69.0000 EACH 20.0000 21.0000 5.00% 25.0000 25.00 % 29.0000 45.00 %

1,380.00 1,449.00 69 1,725.00 345 2,001.00 621
60 PAINT LINE

2670.0000 m 0.4500 0.6500 44.44% 0.4000 -11.11 % 0.4000 -11.11 %
1,201.50 1,735.50 534 1,068.00 -134 1,068.00 -134

61 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
6222.0000 m 0.1800 0.3500 94.44% 0.3500 94.44 % 0.3500 94.44 %

1,119.96 2,177.70 1,058 2,177.70 1,058 2,177.70 1,058
62 PERMANENT SIGNING

L.S. 33.33% 27.74 % 31.67 %
3,000.00 4,000.00 1,000 3,832.30 832 3,950.00 950

63 ILLUMINATION SYSTEM REVISION
L.S. 118.75% 72.66 % 134.38 %

3,200.00 7,000.00 3,800 5,525.00 2,325 7,500.00 4,300
64 PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN

2.0000 EACH 1,500.0000 10,000.0000 566.67% 9,950.0000 563.33 % 10,800.0000 620.00 %
3,000.00 20,000.00 17,000 19,900.00 16,900 21,600.00 18,600

65 OPERATION OF PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN
8160.0000 HR 3.5000 5.0000 42.86% 1.5000 -57.14 % 1.4000 -60.00 %

28,560.00 40,800.00 12,240 12,240.00 -16,320 11,424.00 -17,136
66 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES

L.S. 213.28% -37.34 % -47.79 %
4,788.00 15,000.00 10,212 3,000.00 -1,788 2,500.00 -2,288

67 TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR
3140.0000 HR 31.0000 35.0000 12.90% 33.5000 8.06 % 35.9400 15.94 %

97,340.00 109,900.00 12,560 105,190.00 7,850 112,851.60 15,512
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

GOODFELLOW BROS., INC. JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE 123 SE 4TH 55 MT ADAMS HWY
98801-1530 97702-1357

PROJECT : WENATCHEE   WA  988070598 BEND   OR  977086269 GLENWOOD   WA  986199123

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100296 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100344 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100366

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

TRAFFIC
68 TRAFFIC CONTROL VEHICLE

100.0000 DAY 65.0000 82.0000 26.15% 50.0000 -23.08 % 50.0000 -23.08 %
6,500.00 8,200.00 1,700 5,000.00 -1,500 5,000.00 -1,500

69 TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR
1700.0000 HR 33.0000 37.0000 12.12% 35.2500 6.82 % 38.5000 16.67 %

56,100.00 62,900.00 6,800 59,925.00 3,825 65,450.00 9,350
70 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A

28.3500 m2 110.0000 150.0000 36.36% 80.0000 -27.27 % 86.0000 -21.82 %
3,118.50 4,252.50 1,134 2,268.00 -851 2,438.10 -680

OTHER ITEMS
71 DELETED ITEM

0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00 % 0.0000 0.00 %
0.00 0.00 0 0.00 0 0.00 0

72 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00% 0.0000 0.00 % 0.0000 0.00 %

0.00 0.00 0 0.00 0 0.00 0
73 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL

2498.0000 m3 8.0000 36.0000 350.00% 30.0000 275.00 % 12.5000 56.25 %
19,984.00 89,928.00 69,944 74,940.00 54,956 31,225.00 11,241

74 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CLASS B
925.0000 m2 6.0000 7.0000 16.67% 10.0000 66.67 % 20.0000 233.33 %

5,550.00 6,475.00 925 9,250.00 3,700 18,500.00 12,950
75  FOUNDATION MATERIAL CLASS B

355.0000 m3 20.0000 38.0000 90.00% 35.0000 75.00 % 95.0000 375.00 %
7,100.00 13,490.00 6,390 12,425.00 5,325 33,725.00 26,625

76 TRAINING
1000.0000 HR 2.0000 1.0000 -50.00% 2.0000 0.00 % 4.0000 100.00 %

2,000.00 1,000.00 -1,000 2,000.00 0 4,000.00 2,000
77 STRUCTURE SURVEYING

L.S. 316.67% 316.67 % 377.78 %
7,200.00 30,000.00 22,800 30,000.00 22,800 34,400.00 27,200

78 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00 6,000.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

GOODFELLOW BROS., INC. JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE 123 SE 4TH 55 MT ADAMS HWY
98801-1530 97702-1357

PROJECT : WENATCHEE   WA  988070598 BEND   OR  977086269 GLENWOOD   WA  986199123

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100296 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100344 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100366

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

OTHER ITEMS
79 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE

EST. 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %
5.00 5.00 5.00 5.00

80 MINOR CHANGE
CALC 0.00% 0.00 % 0.00 %

1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
81 SPILL PREVENTION PLAN

L.S. -60.00% -60.00 % 100.00 %
1,250.00 500.00 -750 500.00 -750 2,500.00 1,250

82 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR SEPARATION
4435.0000 m2 3.0000 10.0000 233.33% 1.2500 -58.33 % 1.2000 -60.00 %

13,305.00 44,350.00 31,045 5,543.75 -7,761 5,322.00 -7,983
83 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR TEMPORARY SILT FENCE

1460.0000 m 10.0000 10.0000 0.00% 6.0000 -40.00 % 14.0000 40.00 %
14,600.00 14,600.00 0 8,760.00 -5,840 20,440.00 5,840

84 TEMPORARY GEOSYNTHETIC RETAINING WALL
437.0000 m2 110.0000 100.0000 -9.09% 60.0000 -45.45 % 72.0000 -34.55 %

48,070.00 43,700.00 -4,370 26,220.00 -21,850 31,464.00 -16,606

BASE TOTAL $2,502,777.48 $3,210,302.70 28.27% $3,283,228.95 31.18 % $3,458,643.95 38.19 %
ALTERNATE A1

85  TEMPORARY BRIDGE - A1
L.S. -100.00% -16.36 % -1.73 %

275,000.00 0.00 -275,000 230,000.00 -45,000 270,250.00 -4,750

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL $275,000.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $230,000.00 -16.36 % $270,250.00 -1.73 %
ALTERNATE A2

86  TEMPORARY BRIDGE - A2
L.S. -22.22% 0.00 % 15.56 %

225,000.00 175,000.00 -50,000 225,000.00 0 260,000.00 35,000

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $225,000.00 $175,000.00 -22.22% $225,000.00 0.00 % $260,000.00 15.56 %
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

GOODFELLOW BROS., INC. JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC. JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.
1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE 123 SE 4TH 55 MT ADAMS HWY
98801-1530 97702-1357

PROJECT : WENATCHEE   WA  988070598 BEND   OR  977086269 GLENWOOD   WA  986199123

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100296 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100344 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100366

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF. TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

BASE + A1 TOTAL $2,777,777.48 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $3,513,228.95 26.48% $3,728,893.95 34.24%

BASE + A2 TOTAL $2,727,777.48 $3,385,302.70 24.10% $3,508,228.95 28.61% $3,718,643.95 36.33%
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 7TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S. 153.83%
157,586.52 400,000.00 242,413

2  CLEARING
L.S. 81.00%

3,315.00 6,000.00 2,685
3 CLEARING AND GRUBBING

L.S. 344.44%
2,250.00 10,000.00 7,750

4 ARCHAEOLOGICAL AND PALEONTOLOGICAL SALVAGE
EST. 0.00%

1.00 1.00
5 REMOVING EXISTING BRIDGE NO. 97/116

L.S. 20.00%
25,000.00 30,000.00 5,000

6 REMOVING GUARDRAIL
74.0000 m 6.5000 14.0000 115.38%

481.00 1,036.00 555
7 REMOVING GUARDRAIL ANCHOR

4.0000 EACH 150.0000 180.0000 20.00%
600.00 720.00 120

8 REMOVING TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
2360.0000 m 0.2500 1.8000 620.00%

590.00 4,248.00 3,658
9 REMOVING PAINT LINE

460.0000 m 1.6000 2.6500 65.63%
736.00 1,219.00 483

10 REMOVING MISCELLANEOUS TRAFFIC ITEM
L.S. 1,251.35%

111.00 1,500.00 1,389
GRADING

11 ROADWAY EXCAVATION INCL. HAUL
1825.0000 m3 10.0000 24.0000 140.00%

18,250.00 43,800.00 25,550
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 7TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

GRADING
12 COMMON BORROW INCL. HAUL

3210.0000 m3 7.5000 10.0000 33.33%
24,075.00 32,100.00 8,025

13 GRAVEL BORROW INCL. HAUL
19466.0000 t 6.0000 13.0000 116.67%

116,796.00 253,058.00 136,262
14 EMBANKMENT COMPACTION

12240.0000 m3 1.5000 4.0000 166.67%
18,360.00 48,960.00 30,600

15  DETOUR REMOVAL
6760.0000 m3 12.0000 6.5000 -45.83%

81,120.00 43,940.00 -37,180
DRAINAGE

16 GRATE INLET TYPE 2
2.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 1,500.0000 -25.00%

4,000.00 3,000.00 -1,000
17 FILTER BLANKET

160.0000 m3 14.0000 40.0000 185.71%
2,240.00 6,400.00 4,160

18 LIGHT LOOSE RIPRAP
589.0000 m3 40.0000 40.0000 0.00%

23,560.00 23,560.00 0
19  MODIFIED HEAVY LOOSE RIP RAP

26.0000 m3 50.0000 60.0000 20.00%
1,300.00 1,560.00 260

20 DRAIN PIPE 300 MM DIAM.
14.0000 m 80.0000 100.0000 25.00%

1,120.00 1,400.00 280
21  3.66M X 1.83M PRECAST REINF. CONC. BOX CULVERT

151.2000 m 2,200.0000 4,400.0000 100.00%
332,640.00 665,280.00 332,640

22  1.83M X 0.91M PRECAST REINF. CONC. BOX CULVERT
25.6000 m 1,100.0000 2,600.0000 136.36%

28,160.00 66,560.00 38,400
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 7TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

STRUCTURE
23 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS A INCL. HAUL

81.0000 m3 30.0000 40.0000 33.33%
2,430.00 3,240.00 810

24 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A
L.S. -99.99%

15,000.00 1.00 -14,999
25  SOIL EXCAVATION FOR SHAFT INCLUDING HAUL

289.0000 m3 250.0000 475.0000 90.00%
72,250.00 137,275.00 65,025

26  FURNISHING & PLACING TEMP. CASING FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT
15.0000 m 300.0000 100.0000 -66.67%

4,500.00 1,500.00 -3,000
27  FURNISHING PERMANENT CASING FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT

15.0000 m 400.0000 300.0000 -25.00%
6,000.00 4,500.00 -1,500

28  PLACING PERMANENT CASING FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT
4.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 2,000.0000 100.00%

4,000.00 8,000.00 4,000
29  CASING SHORING

3.0000 m 400.0000 100.0000 -75.00%
1,200.00 300.00 -900

30  SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CL. A FOR 1.830 DIAM. SHAFT
L.S. -87.50%

8,000.00 1,000.00 -7,000
31  CONC. CLASS 28P FOR SHAFT

289.0000 m3 200.0000 150.0000 -25.00%
57,800.00 43,350.00 -14,450

32  ST. REINF. BAR FOR SHAFT
36660.0000 kg 1.1000 1.1000 0.00%

40,326.00 40,326.00 0
33  CSL ACCESS TUBE

455.0000 m 8.0000 12.0000 50.00%
3,640.00 5,460.00 1,820

34  REMOVING OBSTRUCTIONS
EST. 0.00%

20,000.00 20,000.00
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 7TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

STRUCTURE
35 DEFICIENT STRENGTH CONC. PRICE ADJUSTMENT

CALC 0.00%
1.00 1.00

36 ST. REINF. BAR FOR BRIDGE
14240.0000 kg 1.1000 1.0000 -9.09%

15,664.00 14,240.00 -1,424
37 CONC. CLASS 28 FOR BRIDGE

184.0000 m3 500.0000 300.0000 -40.00%
92,000.00 55,200.00 -36,800

38 SUPERSTRUCTURE BRIDGE NO. 97/116
L.S. 72.31%

325,000.00 560,000.00 235,000
SURFACING

39 CRUSHED SURFACING BASE COURSE
5892.0000 t 12.0000 15.0000 25.00%

70,704.00 88,380.00 17,676
LIQUID ASPHALT

40 ANTI-STRIPPING ADDITIVE
EST. 0.00%

9,970.00 9,970.00
CEMENT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

41 BRIDGE APPROACH SLAB
237.6000 m2 150.0000 175.0000 16.67%

35,640.00 41,580.00 5,940
ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT

42 CRACK SEALING
EST. 0.00%

2,800.00 2,800.00
43 PLANING BITUMINOUS PAVEMENT

407.0000 m2 15.0000 18.0000 20.00%
6,105.00 7,326.00 1,221

44 ASPHALT CONC. PAVEMENT CL. A PG 64-28
9970.0000 t 31.0000 40.0000 29.03%

309,070.00 398,800.00 89,730
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 7TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

ASPHALT CONCRETE PAVEMENT
45 JOB MIX COMPLIANCE PRICE ADJUSTMENT

CALC 0.00%
9,273.00 9,273.00

46 COMPACTION PRICE ADJUSTMENT
CALC 0.00%

4,410.00 4,410.00
EROSION CONTROL AND PLANTING

47 SEEDING
0.9300 ha 2,500.0000 1,000.0000 -60.00%

2,325.00 930.00 -1,395
48 MULCHING

0.9300 ha 2,000.0000 2,000.0000 0.00%
1,860.00 1,860.00 0

49  LOG WITH ROOT WAD
3.0000 EACH 1,000.0000 250.0000 -75.00%

3,000.00 750.00 -2,250
50  STRAW BALE SEDIMENT POND

150.0000 m 40.0000 40.0000 0.00%
6,000.00 6,000.00 0

51  BANK REVEGETATION
EST. 0.00%

1,845.00 1,845.00
TRAFFIC

52 EXTRUDED CURB
27.0000 m 20.0000 100.0000 400.00%

540.00 2,700.00 2,160
53 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1

810.0000 m 38.0000 41.0000 7.89%
30,780.00 33,210.00 2,430

54 BEAM GUARDRAIL TYPE 1 - 2.4 M LONG POST
937.0000 m 45.0000 45.0000 0.00%

42,165.00 42,165.00 0
55 BEAM GUARDRAIL TRANSITION SECTION TYPE 1

4.0000 EACH 1,300.0000 1,400.0000 7.69%
5,200.00 5,600.00 400
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 7TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

TRAFFIC
56 BEAM GUARDRAIL NON-FLARED TERMINAL

7.0000 EACH 2,000.0000 2,100.0000 5.00%
14,000.00 14,700.00 700

57 BEAM GUARDRAIL ANCHOR TYPE 1
1.0000 EACH 450.0000 530.0000 17.78%

450.00 530.00 80
58 TEMPORARY CONC. BARRIER

2919.0000 m 35.0000 49.0000 40.00%
102,165.00 143,031.00 40,866

59 FLEXIBLE GUIDE POST
69.0000 EACH 20.0000 23.0000 15.00%

1,380.00 1,587.00 207
60 PAINT LINE

2670.0000 m 0.4500 1.0000 122.22%
1,201.50 2,670.00 1,469

61 TEMPORARY PAVEMENT MARKING
6222.0000 m 0.1800 0.6500 261.11%

1,119.96 4,044.30 2,924
62 PERMANENT SIGNING

L.S. 53.33%
3,000.00 4,600.00 1,600

63 ILLUMINATION SYSTEM REVISION
L.S. 64.06%

3,200.00 5,250.00 2,050
64 PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN

2.0000 EACH 1,500.0000 10,000.0000 566.67%
3,000.00 20,000.00 17,000

65 OPERATION OF PORTABLE CHANGEABLE MESSAGE SIGN
8160.0000 HR 3.5000 5.0000 42.86%

28,560.00 40,800.00 12,240
66 TEMPORARY TRAFFIC CONTROL DEVICES

L.S. 204.93%
4,788.00 14,600.00 9,812

67 TRAFFIC CONTROL LABOR
3140.0000 HR 31.0000 31.0000 0.00%

97,340.00 97,340.00 0
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 7TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

TRAFFIC
68 TRAFFIC CONTROL VEHICLE

100.0000 DAY 65.0000 80.0000 23.08%
6,500.00 8,000.00 1,500

69 TRAFFIC CONTROL SUPERVISOR
1700.0000 HR 33.0000 36.0000 9.09%

56,100.00 61,200.00 5,100
70 CONSTRUCTION SIGNS CLASS A

28.3500 m2 110.0000 150.0000 36.36%
3,118.50 4,252.50 1,134

OTHER ITEMS
71 DELETED ITEM

0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00%
0.00 0.00 0

72 DELETED ITEM
0.0100 EACH 0.0001 0.0000 0.00%

0.00 0.00 0
73 STRUCTURE EXCAVATION CLASS B INCL. HAUL

2498.0000 m3 8.0000 13.0000 62.50%
19,984.00 32,474.00 12,490

74 SHORING OR EXTRA EXCAVATION CLASS B
925.0000 m2 6.0000 20.0000 233.33%

5,550.00 18,500.00 12,950
75  FOUNDATION MATERIAL CLASS B

355.0000 m3 20.0000 95.0000 375.00%
7,100.00 33,725.00 26,625

76 TRAINING
1000.0000 HR 2.0000 1.0000 -50.00%

2,000.00 1,000.00 -1,000
77 STRUCTURE SURVEYING

L.S. 288.89%
7,200.00 28,000.00 20,800

78 ROADSIDE CLEANUP
EST. 0.00%

6,000.00 6,000.00
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 7TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

OTHER ITEMS
79 REIMBURSEMENT FOR THIRD PARTY DAMAGE

EST. 0.00%
5.00 5.00

80 MINOR CHANGE
CALC 0.00%

1.00 1.00
81 SPILL PREVENTION PLAN

L.S. 100.00%
1,250.00 2,500.00 1,250

82 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR SEPARATION
4435.0000 m2 3.0000 1.2000 -60.00%

13,305.00 5,322.00 -7,983
83 CONSTRUCTION GEOTEXTILE FOR TEMPORARY SILT FENCE

1460.0000 m 10.0000 14.0000 40.00%
14,600.00 20,440.00 5,840

84 TEMPORARY GEOSYNTHETIC RETAINING WALL
437.0000 m2 110.0000 72.0000 -34.55%

48,070.00 31,464.00 -16,606

BASE TOTAL $2,502,777.48 $3,798,369.80 51.77%
ALTERNATE A1

85  TEMPORARY BRIDGE - A1
L.S. 4.00%

275,000.00 286,000.00 11,000

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL $275,000.00 $286,000.00 4.00%
ALTERNATE A2

86  TEMPORARY BRIDGE - A2
L.S. -100.00%

225,000.00 0.00 -225,000

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $225,000.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
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* * *  BID CHECK REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 REVISION NO : BIDS OPENED ON : Jul 25 2001
CONTRACT NO: 006207 REGION NO : 5 AWARDED ON : Jul 31 2001
VERSION NO : 3 WORK ORDER# : 0L2899
HWY : SR 097 ------- 7TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : SR 97 
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
 01Y009

F.E. WARD, INC.
2710 NE 78TH ST

PROJECT : VANCOUVER   WA  986650692

COUNTY(S) : YAKIMA CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 861500

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ % DIFF./
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT AMT.DIFF.

DATE:
TIME:

07/24/2001
09:54

DOT_RGGB01

 BR-0097(092), NH-0097(092)

BASE + A1 TOTAL $2,777,777.48 $4,084,369.80 47.04%

BASE + A2 TOTAL $2,727,777.48 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
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DOT_RGGB01 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 * * *   ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS   * * * BIDS OPENED ON:
CONTRACT NO: 006207 * * *   RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT   * * * Jul 25 2001

TITLE: SR 97
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
01Y009

REGION: 5

HWY: SR 097

3501 BROOKLAKE RD. N.
SALEM, OR  973039721

1 $3,001,859.65 BASE + A2 ROSS BROS. & COMPANY, INC.

2208 MAY LN
PO BOX 428
LAGRANDE, OR  978500428

2 $3,103,023.19 BASE + A1 WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO.

2208 MAY LN
PO BOX 428
LAGRANDE, OR  978500428

3 $3,103,023.19 BASE + A2 WEAVER CONSTRUCTION CO.

24635 HWY 20
98284-8012
215 N REED ST
SEDRO WOOLLEY, WA  982841173

4 $3,347,103.04 BASE + A1 ONE WAY CONSTRUCTION, INC.

1407 N WALLA WALLA AVE
98801-1530
PO BOX 598
WENATCHEE, WA  988070598

5 $3,385,302.70 BASE + A2 GOODFELLOW BROS., INC.

123 SE 4TH
97702-1357
PO BOX 6269
BEND, OR  977086269

6 $3,508,228.95 BASE + A2 JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC.

123 SE 4TH
97702-1357
PO BOX 6269
BEND, OR  977086269

7 $3,513,228.95 BASE + A1 JAL CONSTRUCTION, INC.
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DOT_RGGB01 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
PS&E JOB NO: 01Y009 * * *   ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS   * * * BIDS OPENED ON:
CONTRACT NO: 006207 * * *   RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT   * * * Jul 25 2001

TITLE: SR 97
TOPPENISH CREEK VICINITY AND
TOPPENISH CREEK BR. 97/116
01Y009

REGION: 5

HWY: SR 097

55 MT ADAMS HWY
GLENWOOD, WA  986199123

8 $3,718,643.95 BASE + A2 JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.

55 MT ADAMS HWY
GLENWOOD, WA  986199123

9 $3,728,893.95 BASE + A1 JAMES DEAN CONSTRUCTION, INC.

2710 NE 78TH ST
VANCOUVER, WA  986650692

10 $4,084,369.80 BASE + A1 F.E. WARD, INC.


