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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A539 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Jan 30 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006293 REGION NO : 9 AWARDED ON : Feb  4 2002
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : 0L3261
HWY : SR 305 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : BAINBRIDGE ISLAND FERRY TERMINAL
DOLPHIN REPLACEMENT PHASE II

01A539

GENERAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY MANSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY HURLEN CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
3838 WEST MARGINAL WAY SW 5209 E MARGINAL WAY S - 98134-2429700 S RIVERSIDE DR

PO BOX 24067 98108-4366

PROJECT : SEATTLE   WA  981061108 SEATTLE   WA  981240067 SEATTLE   WA  981080945

COUNTY(S) : KITSAP CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 286000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 518000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 392100

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

12/28/2001
14:14

DOT_RGGB05

 FBD 2002(009)

PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S.
235,500.00 200,000.00 212,000.00 160,056.00

2 REMOVAL OF STRUCTURE AND OBSTRUCTION
L.S.

274,000.00 190,000.00 271,000.00 151,800.00
STRUCTURE

3  DRIVING STEEL PILE - 24 INCH DIA.
18.0000 EACH 2,600.0000 1,700.0000 3,200.0000 3,018.0000

46,800.00 30,600.00 57,600.00 54,324.00
4  DRIVING STEEL PILE - 30 INCH DIA.

20.0000 EACH 3,000.0000 1,700.0000 2,000.0000 3,308.0000
60,000.00 34,000.00 40,000.00 66,160.00

5  DRIVING STEEL PILE - 36 INCH DIA.
27.0000 EACH 2,600.0000 700.0000 1,000.0000 2,178.0000

70,200.00 18,900.00 27,000.00 58,806.00
6 CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR DIAPHRAGM

92.0000 C.Y. 800.0000 1,000.0000 800.0000 600.0000
73,600.00 92,000.00 73,600.00 55,200.00

7  POLYETHYLENE RUBBING FACE
27.0000 EACH 6,000.0000 4,500.0000 5,000.0000 3,520.0000

162,000.00 121,500.00 135,000.00 95,040.00
8  MARINE LANTERN & REFLECTIVE TRIANGLE

3.0000 PAIR 2,800.0000 2,500.0000 2,500.0000 2,988.0000
8,400.00 7,500.00 7,500.00 8,964.00

9  MARINE FENDERS
L.S.

82,000.00 55,000.00 53,000.00 78,880.00
OTHER ITEMS

10 SURVEYING
L.S.

15,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 11,000.00
11 SPILL PREVENTION PLAN

L.S.
1,000.00 1,000.00 500.00 1,480.00



PAGE : 2-A
WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A539 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Jan 30 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006293 REGION NO : 9 AWARDED ON : Feb  4 2002
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : 0L3261
HWY : SR 305 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : BAINBRIDGE ISLAND FERRY TERMINAL
DOLPHIN REPLACEMENT PHASE II

01A539

GENERAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY MANSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY HURLEN CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
3838 WEST MARGINAL WAY SW 5209 E MARGINAL WAY S - 98134-2429700 S RIVERSIDE DR

PO BOX 24067 98108-4366

PROJECT : SEATTLE   WA  981061108 SEATTLE   WA  981240067 SEATTLE   WA  981080945

COUNTY(S) : KITSAP CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 286000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 518000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 392100

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

12/28/2001
14:14

DOT_RGGB05

 FBD 2002(009)

OTHER ITEMS
12 MINOR CHANGE

CALC
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00 -1.00

13 FORCE ACCOUNT SOIL PLUG REMOVAL
EST.

1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
14 FORCE ACCOUNT

EST.
10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00

BASE TOTAL $1,038,500.00 $770,500.00 $897,200.00 $751,710.00
ALTERNATE A1

15  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 24 INCH DIA. - DOMESTIC
1530.0000 L.F. 91.0000 90.0000 85.0000 92.5000

139,230.00 137,700.00 130,050.00 141,525.00
16  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 30 INCH DIA. - DOMESTIC

1960.0000 L.F. 120.0000 110.0000 100.0000 113.0000
235,200.00 215,600.00 196,000.00 221,480.00

17  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 36 INCH DIA. - DOMESTIC
2070.0000 L.F. 188.0000 180.0000 160.0000 175.5000

389,160.00 372,600.00 331,200.00 363,285.00
18  STRUCTURAL CARBON STEEL - DOMESTIC

L.S.
789,000.00 519,100.00 626,000.00 690,000.00

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL $1,552,590.00 $1,245,000.00 $1,283,250.00 $1,416,290.00
ALTERNATE A2

19  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 24 INCH DIA. - FOREIGN
1530.0000 L.F. 77.0000 0.0000 66.0000 0.0000

117,810.00 0.00 100,980.00 0.00
20  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 30 INCH DIA. - FOREIGN

1960.0000 L.F. 102.0000 0.0000 97.0000 0.0000
199,920.00 0.00 190,120.00 0.00

21  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 36 INCH DIA. - FOREIGN
2070.0000 L.F. 159.0000 0.0000 153.0000 0.0000

329,130.00 0.00 316,710.00 0.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A539 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Jan 30 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006293 REGION NO : 9 AWARDED ON : Feb  4 2002
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : 0L3261
HWY : SR 305 ------- LOW BIDDER ------- ------- 2ND BIDDER ------- ------- 3RD BIDDER -------

TITLE : BAINBRIDGE ISLAND FERRY TERMINAL
DOLPHIN REPLACEMENT PHASE II

01A539

GENERAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY MANSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY HURLEN CONSTRUCTION COMPANY
3838 WEST MARGINAL WAY SW 5209 E MARGINAL WAY S - 98134-2429700 S RIVERSIDE DR

PO BOX 24067 98108-4366

PROJECT : SEATTLE   WA  981061108 SEATTLE   WA  981240067 SEATTLE   WA  981080945

COUNTY(S) : KITSAP CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 286000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 518000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 392100

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

12/28/2001
14:14

DOT_RGGB05

 FBD 2002(009)

ALTERNATE A2

22  STRUCTURAL CARBON STEEL - FOREIGN
L.S.

721,000.00 0.00 626,000.00 0.00

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $1,367,860.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $1,233,810.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE

BASE + A1 TOTAL $2,591,090.00 $2,015,500.00 $2,180,450.00 $2,168,000.00

BASE + A2 TOTAL $2,406,360.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $2,131,010.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A539 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Jan 30 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006293 REGION NO : 9 AWARDED ON : Feb  4 2002
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : 0L3261
HWY : SR 305 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : BAINBRIDGE ISLAND FERRY TERMINAL
DOLPHIN REPLACEMENT PHASE II

01A539

CULBERTSON MARINE CONSTRUCTION,AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.MKB CONSTRUCTORS
1004 7TH ST # 201 411 13TH ST 3647 STONEWAY NORTH     98103-8003

PO BOX 31449

PROJECT : ANACORTES   WA  982214133 EVERETT   WA  982011693 SEATTLE   WA  981031450

COUNTY(S) : KITSAP CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100353 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 026000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100137

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

12/28/2001
14:14

DOT_RGGB05

 FBD 2002(009)

PREPARATION
1 MOBILIZATION

L.S.
235,500.00 180,000.00 210,000.00 270,000.00

2 REMOVAL OF STRUCTURE AND OBSTRUCTION
L.S.

274,000.00 336,000.00 240,000.00 316,500.00
STRUCTURE

3  DRIVING STEEL PILE - 24 INCH DIA.
18.0000 EACH 2,600.0000 1,800.0000 3,100.0000 10,000.0000

46,800.00 32,400.00 55,800.00 180,000.00
4  DRIVING STEEL PILE - 30 INCH DIA.

20.0000 EACH 3,000.0000 1,800.0000 2,700.0000 6,000.0000
60,000.00 36,000.00 54,000.00 120,000.00

5  DRIVING STEEL PILE - 36 INCH DIA.
27.0000 EACH 2,600.0000 2,400.0000 2,700.0000 3,000.0000

70,200.00 64,800.00 72,900.00 81,000.00
6 CONC. CLASS 4000 FOR DIAPHRAGM

92.0000 C.Y. 800.0000 391.3000 650.0000 1,560.0000
73,600.00 35,999.60 59,800.00 143,520.00

7  POLYETHYLENE RUBBING FACE
27.0000 EACH 6,000.0000 1,990.2200 5,000.0000 5,000.0000

162,000.00 53,735.94 135,000.00 135,000.00
8  MARINE LANTERN & REFLECTIVE TRIANGLE

3.0000 PAIR 2,800.0000 3,600.0000 3,000.0000 2,500.0000
8,400.00 10,800.00 9,000.00 7,500.00

9  MARINE FENDERS
L.S.

82,000.00 90,000.00 67,000.00 70,000.00
OTHER ITEMS

10 SURVEYING
L.S.

15,000.00 14,400.00 2,000.00 10,000.00
11 SPILL PREVENTION PLAN

L.S.
1,000.00 7,200.00 1,000.00 2,000.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A539 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Jan 30 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006293 REGION NO : 9 AWARDED ON : Feb  4 2002
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : 0L3261
HWY : SR 305 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : BAINBRIDGE ISLAND FERRY TERMINAL
DOLPHIN REPLACEMENT PHASE II

01A539

CULBERTSON MARINE CONSTRUCTION,AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.MKB CONSTRUCTORS
1004 7TH ST # 201 411 13TH ST 3647 STONEWAY NORTH     98103-8003

PO BOX 31449

PROJECT : ANACORTES   WA  982214133 EVERETT   WA  982011693 SEATTLE   WA  981031450

COUNTY(S) : KITSAP CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100353 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 026000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100137

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

12/28/2001
14:14

DOT_RGGB05

 FBD 2002(009)

OTHER ITEMS
12 MINOR CHANGE

CALC
-1.00 -1.00 -1.00 -1.00

13 FORCE ACCOUNT SOIL PLUG REMOVAL
EST.

1.00 1.00 1.00 1.00
14 FORCE ACCOUNT

EST.
10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00 10,000.00

BASE TOTAL $1,038,500.00 $871,335.54 $916,500.00 $1,345,520.00
ALTERNATE A1

15  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 24 INCH DIA. - DOMESTIC
1530.0000 L.F. 91.0000 97.0200 86.0000 85.0000

139,230.00 148,440.60 131,580.00 130,050.00
16  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 30 INCH DIA. - DOMESTIC

1960.0000 L.F. 120.0000 119.6400 106.0000 105.0000
235,200.00 234,494.40 207,760.00 205,800.00

17  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 36 INCH DIA. - DOMESTIC
2070.0000 L.F. 188.0000 187.3800 160.0000 165.0000

389,160.00 387,876.60 331,200.00 341,550.00
18  STRUCTURAL CARBON STEEL - DOMESTIC

L.S.
789,000.00 604,800.00 700,000.00 726,000.00

ALTERNATE A1 TOTAL $1,552,590.00 $1,375,611.60 $1,370,540.00 $1,403,400.00
ALTERNATE A2

19  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 24 INCH DIA. - FOREIGN
1530.0000 L.F. 77.0000 78.5200 0.0000 70.0000

117,810.00 120,135.60 0.00 107,100.00
20  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 30 INCH DIA. - FOREIGN

1960.0000 L.F. 102.0000 112.2000 0.0000 110.0000
199,920.00 219,912.00 0.00 215,600.00

21  FURNISHING STEEL PIPE PILES - 36 INCH DIA. - FOREIGN
2070.0000 L.F. 159.0000 181.2200 0.0000 160.0000

329,130.00 375,125.40 0.00 331,200.00
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WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION

* * *  BID TABULATION REPORT  * * *

PS&E JOB NO: 01A539 REVISION NO : 1 BIDS OPENED ON : Jan 30 2002
CONTRACT NO: 006293 REGION NO : 9 AWARDED ON : Feb  4 2002
VERSION NO : 1 WORK ORDER# : 0L3261
HWY : SR 305 ------- 4TH BIDDER ------- ------- 5TH BIDDER ------- ------- 6TH BIDDER -------

TITLE : BAINBRIDGE ISLAND FERRY TERMINAL
DOLPHIN REPLACEMENT PHASE II

01A539

CULBERTSON MARINE CONSTRUCTION,AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.MKB CONSTRUCTORS
1004 7TH ST # 201 411 13TH ST 3647 STONEWAY NORTH     98103-8003

PO BOX 31449

PROJECT : ANACORTES   WA  982214133 EVERETT   WA  982011693 SEATTLE   WA  981031450

COUNTY(S) : KITSAP CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100353 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 026000 CONTRACTOR NUMBER : 100137

ENGR'S. EST.
ITEM
NO.

ITEM DESCRIPTION UNIT
MEAS

PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/ PRICE PER UNIT/
EST. QUANTITY TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT TOTAL AMOUNT

DATE:
TIME:

12/28/2001
14:14

DOT_RGGB05

 FBD 2002(009)

ALTERNATE A2

22  STRUCTURAL CARBON STEEL - FOREIGN
L.S.

721,000.00 608,400.00 0.00 726,000.00

ALTERNATE A2 TOTAL $1,367,860.00 $1,323,573.00 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $1,379,900.00

BASE + A1 TOTAL $2,591,090.00 $2,246,947.14 $2,287,040.00 $2,748,920.00

BASE + A2 TOTAL $2,406,360.00 $2,194,908.54 NO BID THIS ALTERNATE $2,725,420.00
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DOT_RGGB05 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
PS&E JOB NO: 01A539 * * *   ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS   * * * BIDS OPENED ON:
CONTRACT NO: 006293 * * *   RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT   * * * Jan 30 2002

TITLE: BAINBRIDGE ISLAND FERRY TERMINAL
DOLPHIN REPLACEMENT PHASE II

01A539

REGION: 9

HWY: SR 305

3838 WEST MARGINAL WAY SW
SEATTLE, WA  981061108

1 $2,015,500.00 BASE + A1 GENERAL CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

5209 E MARGINAL WAY S - 98134-2429
PO BOX 24067
SEATTLE, WA  981240067

2 $2,131,010.00 BASE + A2 MANSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

700 S RIVERSIDE DR
98108-4366
PO BOX 80945
SEATTLE, WA  981080945

3 $2,168,000.00 BASE + A1 HURLEN CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

5209 E MARGINAL WAY S - 98134-2429
PO BOX 24067
SEATTLE, WA  981240067

4 $2,180,450.00 BASE + A1 MANSON CONSTRUCTION COMPANY

1004 7TH ST # 201
ANACORTES, WA  982214133

5 $2,194,908.54 BASE + A2 CULBERTSON MARINE CONSTRUCTION,
INC.

1004 7TH ST # 201
ANACORTES, WA  982214133

6 $2,246,947.14 BASE + A1 CULBERTSON MARINE CONSTRUCTION,
INC.

411 13TH ST
EVERETT, WA  982011693

7 $2,287,040.00 BASE + A1 AMERICAN CONSTRUCTION CO., INC.

3647 STONEWAY NORTH     98103-8003
PO BOX 31449
SEATTLE, WA  981031450

8 $2,725,420.00 BASE + A2 MKB CONSTRUCTORS
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DOT_RGGB05 WASHINGTON STATE DEPARTMENT OF TRANSPORTATION
PS&E JOB NO: 01A539 * * *   ALTERNATE COMBINATION BIDS   * * * BIDS OPENED ON:
CONTRACT NO: 006293 * * *   RANKED BY DOLLAR AMOUNT   * * * Jan 30 2002

TITLE: BAINBRIDGE ISLAND FERRY TERMINAL
DOLPHIN REPLACEMENT PHASE II

01A539

REGION: 9

HWY: SR 305

3647 STONEWAY NORTH     98103-8003
PO BOX 31449
SEATTLE, WA  981031450

9 $2,748,920.00 BASE + A1 MKB CONSTRUCTORS


